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Joshua H. Haffner, SBN 188652 
(jhh@haffnerlawyers.com) 
Graham G. Lambert, SBN 303056 
(gl@haffnerlawyers.com) 
HAFFNER LAW PC 
445 South Figueroa St., Suite 2325 
Los Angeles, California 90017 
Telephone: (213) 514-5681 
Facsimile: (213) 514-5682 
 
Paul Stevens, SBN 207107 
(pstevens@stevenslc.com)  
STEVENS, LC 
700 S. Flower Street, Suite 660 
Los Angeles, California 90017 
Telephone: (213) 270-1211 
Facsimile: (213) 270-1223 
 
Attorneys for Plaintiffs JACQUELINE IBARRA,  
and the CERTIFIED CLASS 
 
SHEPPARD, MULLIN, RICHTER & HAMPTON LLP 
Thomas R. Kaufman, Cal. Bar No. 177936 
tkaufman@sheppardmullin.com 
Paul Berkowitz, Cal. Bar No. 251077 
pberkowitz@sheppardmullin.com 
1901 Avenue of the Stars, Suite 1600 
Los Angeles, California 90067-6055 
Telephone: 310.228.3700 
Facsimile: 310.228.3701 
 
Attorneys for Defendant 
WELLS FARGO BANK, N.A 
 

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 

CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA 
 

JACQUELINE F. IBARRA, an 
individual; on behalf of himself and all 
other similarly situated, 

Plaintiff, 

vs. 

WELLS FARGO BANK, NA.; and 
DOES 1 through 50, inclusive, 

Defendants. 
 

 Case No. 2:17-cv-4344 PA(ASx) 
 
JOINT STATEMENT RE: MOTION 
FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND 
NONTAXABLE COSTS 
 
Date:        July 16, 2018 
Time:       1:30 p.m._ 
Crtrm:      9A 
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Pursuant to the Court’s May 14, 2018 order, Docket No.52, the parties hereby 

submit the following joint statement in connection with Plaintiff’s motion for 

attorney fees and costs. 

The parties’ position as to the attorney’s fees being sought by Plaintiff are set 

forth in the joint statement spreadsheet attached hereto as Exhibit A, and incorporated 

herein by reference.  The parties’ position as to non-taxable costs being sought by 

Plaintiff are set for in the joint statement spreadsheet attached hereto as Exhibit B, 

and incorporated herein by reference.  Attached as Exhibit C to this joint statement is 

Class counsel’s documentation in support of the non-taxable costs. 
 

 
 
 
DATED:  June 18, 2018    STEVENS LC 
 
 
 By: _/s/ Paul D. Stevens_____ 

 Paul D. Stevens 
 Attorneys for Plaintiffs  

 
 
 
DATED:  June 18, 2018 SHEPPARD, MULLIN, RICHTER & 

HAMPTON, LLP 
 
 
 By: _/s/ Thomas R. Kaufman____ 

 Thomas R. Kaufman 
 Attorneys for Defendant  

 
 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS   Document 62-4   Filed 06/18/18   Page 2 of 115   Page ID #:1349



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT A 
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Date Biller Work Description Number of Hours 
Worked 

(Requested)

Respondent's Position Summary of Movant's Position Summary of Respondent's 
Position 

3/11/2018 Andrew Kubik Legal Research damages issue 5.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/12/2018 Andrew Kubik Legal Research damages issue 7.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Andrew Kubik Legal Research damages issue 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Andrew Kubik Legal Research damages issue 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/15/2018 Andrew Kubik Legal Research damages issue 3.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

TOTAL: 25.2

3/16/2017 Graham Lambert
Review/Analyze Complaint and Client docs for 
PAGA letter

0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/16/2017 Graham Lambert Draft Paga Letter 1.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2017 Graham Lambert Strategize w/ Josh re PAGA Letter 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/17/2017 Graham Lambert Draft Email to Josh re PAGA letter 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/17/2017 Graham Lambert Revise PAGA letter 0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/21/2017 Graham Lambert Review case assignment 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/22/2017 Graham Lambert
Strategize w/ Josh re PAGA letter to Additional 
entities 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/22/2017 Graham Lambert Draft PAGA letter to additional Wells Fargo entity 0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/23/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to Maisha re instructions for serving 
PAGA letter 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to Josh re New PAGA letter to Wells 
Fargo Home Mortgage 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to Maisha re serving PAGA letter to WF 
Home Mortgage 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2017 Graham Lambert Draft Paga letter to Wells Fargo Home Mrotgage 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2017 Graham Lambert
Drafte email to Josh and Paul re additional Wells 
Fargo entity 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2017 Graham Lambert
Research re Home Mortgatge Entity on Secratry of 
State website 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/11/2017 Graham Lambert Call from opp counsel re wrong entity on complaint 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/11/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to Josh and Paul re call from opp 
counsel re wrong entity 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/11/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to Josh and Paul re opp counsel contact 
info 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/11/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email to Paul re confromed complaint 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/12/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails from opp counsel re wage statements fo 
Plaitniff and other complaints 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/12/2017 Graham Lambert Review Plaintiff wage statements 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/12/2017 Graham Lambert
Review other complaints provided by Defendant re 
proper entity defendant 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/13/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re case 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re conference all w/ opp counsel 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Graham Lambert teleconference with co-counsel and opp counsel 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/20/2017 Graham Lambert Emails w/ co-counsel re case 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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4/21/2017 Graham Lambert

Email  from Joshua Haffner re adding PAGA cause 
of action and Wells Fargo bank NA to first amended 
complaint 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email to Josh re FAC 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Graham Lambert Email from opp counsel re arbitration agreement 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Graham Lambert Strategize re Barreras Agreement to arbitrate 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/1/2017 Graham Lambert
Email re Decl in Support of Request for Dismissal 
Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/1/2017 Graham Lambert Review proposed declaration iso dismissal 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2017 Graham Lambert Draft dismissal w/o prejudice for Barreras 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/4/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re damages analysis 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/4/2017 Graham Lambert Revise declaration supporting request for dismissal 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/8/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re intial status conference 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/8/2017 Graham Lambert Review initial status conference order 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re Barreras dismissal 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email re joint ISC stmt 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Graham Lambert Draft initial status conf. statement 1.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Graham Lambert Reivew notice of rejection of dismissal 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/15/2017 Graham Lambert Srtategize re ISC statement re dismissal and FAC 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/15/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email circulating ISC statement 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/15/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re scheduling ISC meet and confer 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email to co-counsel re joint ISC stmt 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re finalizing joint ISC statemnt for filing 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/18/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re revisions to FAC 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/22/2017 Graham Lambert
Email  from Paul Stevens  re dismissal and 
declaration 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/23/2017 Graham Lambert Review revised dismissal and declaration 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2017 Graham Lambert Review memo re status conference 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/5/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re filing of FAC 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/12/2017 Graham Lambert Review answer to FAC 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/13/2017 Graham Lambert Email notification re conformed copy filed 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/13/2017 Graham Lambert
Review email re non-conformed copy of complaint 
filed 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/13/2017 Graham Lambert Review email re answer to FAC filed 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/13/2017 Graham Lambert Review notice of assignment 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Graham Lambert Review standing order from judge 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Graham Lambert Email notification from court re 26(f) conference 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Graham Lambert Review scheduling order 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/15/2017 Graham Lambert Review removal papers 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/15/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re removal of case 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/20/2017 Graham Lambert Draft memo to principal re diversity of case 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/20/2017 Graham Lambert research re diversity of national associations 0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/20/2017 Graham Lambert Research re removal of national associations 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/20/2017 Graham Lambert Review motion to remove 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/22/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email re 90 class certification continuance stip 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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6/22/2017 Graham Lambert participate in rule 26(f) conference 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/23/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft and revise sipulation re 90-day class cert 
deadline 1.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/23/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to Josh and Paul re 90-day continuance 
stip 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/23/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email to opp counsel re 90-continuance stip 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/23/2017 Graham Lambert
Review document requestws from Wells Fargo and 
notice of depo 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/23/2017 Graham Lambert
Strat re draft of stipulation to continue class 
certification 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/26/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email to Josh re discovery 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/26/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to Josh re discovery and PMK depo 
notice 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/27/2017 Graham Lambert
Provide instructions to law clerk re dsicovery/intial 
disclosures 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/27/2017 Graham Lambert Draft emial to co-counsel P. Stevens re stipulation 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/27/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails with opp counsel re stipulation to continue 
class cert 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/27/2017 Graham Lambert Revise stip to continue class certificaiton 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/28/2017 Graham Lambert Draft emial to P. Berkowitz re revised stipulation 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/3/2017 Graham Lambert Review Wells Fargo revisions to stipulation 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/3/2017 Graham Lambert Research re intial disoclosures 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re intital disclosures 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Graham Lambert Review Defendant's intial disclosures 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Graham Lambert Review revisions to Plaintiff's initial disclosures 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re serving intital disclosures 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Graham Lambert Call w/ co-counsel re case 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email to co-counsel re joint 26(f) stmt 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re final intital disclosures 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Graham Lambert Review joint statement 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/7/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to Josh to strategize re scheduling 
timeiline for depositions 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/7/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails to and from P. Berkowitz re stip and joint 
statement 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/7/2017 Graham Lambert
Review order denying stipulation to continue class 
cert 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/7/2017 Graham Lambert Email from co-counsel re documents/doc production 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Graham Lambert Review documents from client 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Graham Lambert Revise joint statement & stip re co-counsel 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/12/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email to Josh re intial disclosures 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Graham Lambert Draft email to Josh re PMK depo notice 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/12/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails re next steps in light of denial of stip to 
continue 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/13/2017 Graham Lambert Strategize re responses to RFPs 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/20/2017 Graham Lambert
Review email notice from court re schedule of trial 
and pretrial dates 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/20/2017 Graham Lambert Review order re scheduling and trial dates 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/20/2017 Graham Lambert Email from Josh re slecting mediator 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Graham Lambert Emails with opp counsel re selecting mediator 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/21/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails discsssing the stipulation language and rest 
break cause of action 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/24/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re medaition scheduling 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/25/2017 Graham Lambert
Review notice of order granting stipulated class cert 
as to rest breaks 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/26/2017 Graham Lambert Review Defendant's objections to PMK depo notice 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re drafting class notice 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/26/2017 Graham Lambert Review estimate from CPT for notice/administration 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Graham Lambert Review Wells Fargo's responses to RFP.02 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/27/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails re RFP.02 responses and document 
production 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/27/2017 Graham Lambert Review document production 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re doc production 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Graham Lambert Emails w/ CPT group re mailing 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/3/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re scheduling PMK deposition 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/3/2017 Graham Lambert
Email received from Praveeta Garcia w/ Plaintiff's 
document production 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/11/2017 Graham Lambert Email re PMK depo schedule 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/15/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re Pltf depositon schedule 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/18/2017 Graham Lambert
Review notice email approving joint stipulation for 
class certificaiton 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/18/2017 Graham Lambert Email scheduling PMK and plaintiff depositions 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re experts and expert strategy 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/21/2017 Graham Lambert
Strategize re additional discovery to 
propound/review proposed discovery 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/28/2017 Graham Lambert
Email from wells fargo w/ additional production of 
docs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/29/2017 Graham Lambert
Re3view notice of order approving proposed class 
notice 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/29/2017 Graham Lambert Review additional produciton of documents 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/30/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails with CPT re order granting class certification 
and class notice form 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/6/2017 Graham Lambert Call from CPT group re settlement administration 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/6/2017 Graham Lambert Call to CPT Group re adminstrating settlement 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/6/2017 Graham Lambert
Draft email to CPT group re settlement 
administration 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/6/2017 Graham Lambert
Email received from CPT with proposed notice and 
opt-out forms 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/11/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails re approving proposed notice and opt-out 
forms 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/12/2017 Graham Lambert
Emails re approving proposed notice and opt-out 
forms 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/12/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re mailing deadline and response deadline 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/13/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re changing mailing date 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/14/2017 Graham Lambert Emails confirming change to mailing date 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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9/15/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re revised mailing documents 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/15/2017 Graham Lambert

Email received from Kelsey Skey - RE: Ibarra v. 
Wells Fargo - Mailing Documents for 
Review/Approval 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/18/2017 Graham Lambert Email from CPT confirming maililng of notices 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Graham Lambert Call from class member nenez re commission 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Graham Lambert Email to CPT re adding class memember 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/20/2017 Graham Lambert
Email received from Paul Stevens - Re: Ibarra v. 
Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/25/2017 Graham Lambert Review Wells fargo responses to Rog.01 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/25/2017 Graham Lambert Vociemail from class member 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/25/2017 Graham Lambert Strategize re call from class member 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/26/2017 Graham Lambert Review anaonymous letter re Wells Fargo 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/29/2017 Graham Lambert Emails re invalid opt-out 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Graham Lambert Email re revisions to stipulation of facts 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Graham Lambert Review notice email re local rule 5-4.3.1 formatting 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/16/2017 Graham Lambert Strategize re meet and confer re Rog.01 responses 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Graham Lambert Review interrogatory resposnes 0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Graham Lambert Draft meet and confer letter 1.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Graham Lambert Drafte email to Josh re meet and confer letter 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/16/2017 Graham Lambert
Research re federal prcedure and objections to 
motion to compel 1.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/17/2017 Graham Lambert Email from Paul re revision to meet and confer letter 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Graham Lambert Strategize re revisions to meet and confer letter 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Graham Lambert revise meet anc confer letter re Sprog responses 0.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Graham Lambert Send emet and confer letter to opp counsel 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/20/2017 Graham Lambert Review notice of filing re stip re damages discovery 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/25/2017 Graham Lambert
Email from CPT froup re invalid opt-out Fernando 
Snachez 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/26/2017 Graham Lambert Review notice of filing of stipulated facts for MSJs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/31/2017 Graham Lambert Review Rog.02 and RFp.02 responses 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/3/2017 Graham Lambert Call from  class member 1.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/9/2017 Graham Lambert
Email notices of filing MSJ by plaintiff and by 
defendant 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/9/2017 Graham Lambert Review Defendant's MSJ 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/13/2017 Graham Lambert
Email from Ashley re class memebr who called an 
left a message 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/15/2017 Graham Lambert Email received from counsel for opt-out Mggiulli 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/16/2017 Graham Lambert
Email received from Ashley re call from class action 
member 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/1/2017 Graham Lambert Email from CPT w/ declaration re status 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Graham Lambert Review CPT status declaration 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/4/2017 Graham Lambert
Review notice of filing of opposition to Platintiff's 
MSJ 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/5/2017 Graham Lambert Notice of Plaitniff's opposition to MSJ 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/18/2017 Graham Lambert Review Defendant's reply brief iso MSJ 0.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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1/19/2018 Graham Lambert
Review email notice re MSJ hearing off calendar 
and under submission 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/23/2018 Graham Lambert
Review email notice re granting Plaitniff's MSJ and 
denying Defendant's MSJ 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/26/2018 Graham Lambert
Review email notice re stip for modified schedule re 
damages 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/26/2018 Graham Lambert Email from mediator re mediation 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/29/2018 Graham Lambert
Review email notice re order continuing pretrial 
deadlines 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/29/2018 Graham Lambert Emails re mediation fees and location 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Graham Lambert Review letter from mediator 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/12/2018 Graham Lambert Review expert disclosre from Defendant 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/14/2018 Graham Lambert Email notice re filing of joint facts for trial 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/15/2018 Graham Lambert Email notice re order approving joint facts for trial 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/23/2018 Graham Lambert Draft email re conentions of fact and law 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Graham Lambert Emails re pretrial conference appearances 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/16/2018 Graham Lambert
Notice of filing of trial brief and proposed findings 
of fact and law 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/16/2018 Graham Lambert Review Defendant's trial brief 1.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/21/2018 Graham Lambert Emails re mediator's proposal 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Graham Lambert Email notices re filing of response briefs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Graham Lambert Review Defendant's response brief 0.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/6/2018 Graham Lambert Email notice re trial date vacated 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/6/2018 Graham Lambert
Review order re trial dates and ruling on briefs as 
submitted 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/9/2018 Graham Lambert Email notice re order re attorneys fees 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/9/2018 Graham Lambert Review order re attorneys fees motion 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Graham Lambert Emails re motion for attorneys fees 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/23/2018 Graham Lambert Call w/ Paul re motion for attorneys' fees 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/23/2018 Graham Lambert Generate/edit spreadsheet of attorneys fees 1.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/23/2018 Graham Lambert Review Court order re attorney fees 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2018 Graham Lambert Add to and edit attorneys' fees spreadsheet 1.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2018 Graham Lambert Call w/ P. Stevens re attorrney fees 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2018 Graham Lambert Emails with Paul re attorneys fees 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/24/2018 Graham Lambert
Email received from Paul Stevens - Wells Fargo - 
Sep Statements and Upcoming Dates 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/25/2018 Graham Lambert Compile and revise attorneys fees 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/25/2018 Graham Lambert Email re Wells fargo and attorneys fees 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/26/2018 Graham Lambert Revise hours/fees spreadsheet 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2018 Graham Lambert Review order re motion for attorney fees 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2018 Graham Lambert Revise motion for attorney fees spereadsheet 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2018 Graham Lambert Research re including time drafting attorney fee moti 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

TOTAL: 64.8

3/2/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells fargo 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/5/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal research 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/8/2017 Joshua Haffner Email  to co-counsel re Wells Fargo class action. 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/8/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal research re rest break claim 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2017 Joshua Haffner Email from co-counsel 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/13/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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3/14/2017 Joshua Haffner
Meet with Clients and co-counsel; work on draft of 
complaint; email 7.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/15/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on complaint; emails 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on complaint; finalize; emails 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/17/2017 Joshua Haffner Draft PAGA letter; emails 1.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/17/2017 Joshua Haffner Finalize complaint for filing 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/21/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with client/co-counsel 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/22/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with office and co-counsel Wells Fargo 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2017 Joshua Haffner Review documents, research, TC Paul, emails e 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2017 Joshua Haffner TC Paul; review documents; research; emails 1.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/24/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal research 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise PAGA letter; emails 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails/confer re Wells Fargo class action 0.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/12/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re Wells Fargo; work on case 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/12/2017 Joshua Haffner TC co-counsel 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/13/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re Wells Fargo case 0.9 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/14/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with defense counsel and co-counsel re case. 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/17/2017 Joshua Haffner
Legal research, call with defense counsel, Paul, 
emails 2.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/18/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/19/2017 Joshua Haffner Review status conf order 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/20/2017 Joshua Haffner Email with defense counsel and co-counsel 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/21/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/23/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel and defense counsel 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Joshua Haffner TC co counsel re case, emails 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/25/2017 Joshua Haffner Prepare notice of ISC; TC co-counsel 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/28/2017 Joshua Haffner
Emails with defense counsel and co-counsel re 
arbitration issues as to Barrera 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/28/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on FAC; emails 2.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/1/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on FAC; TC co-counsel; emails 2.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2017 Joshua Haffner Declaration re dismissal; emails  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2017 Joshua Haffner TC co-counsel re case 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/4/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re demand in Wells Fargo 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/4/2017 Joshua Haffner Finalize request for dismissal 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/5/2017 Joshua Haffner
Legal research; draft letter re possible mediation; 
TC co-counsel; emails 4.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/8/2017 Joshua Haffner Demand letter; Email re Wells Fargo 0.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/9/2017 Joshua Haffner IEmails with co-counsel, Paul Stevens 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/10/2017 Joshua Haffner Tc Paul; revise demand letter 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on demand letter 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2017 Joshua Haffner
Finalize demand; emails with co-counsel and 
defense counsel 1.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/15/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review notice of rejection of request for dismissal; 
obtain and review Nguyen docket, emails 1.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/16/2017 Joshua Haffner
Call with Paul; work on joint statement; call with 
opposing counsel; emails 5.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/17/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel re Wells Fargo 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/18/2017 Joshua Haffner TC Paul; work on FAC 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/22/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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5/23/2017 Joshua Haffner
Prep for hearing tmrw; Tc Paul re substituing 
defendant; emails 1.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/23/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise request for dismissal 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/24/2017 Joshua Haffner
Attend status conference; CF Paul Stevens; prepare 
notice of ruling; emails 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/25/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells fargo 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/26/2017 Joshua Haffner Review order dismissing Barreras 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/2/2017 Joshua Haffner

Draft/revise FAC; Revise notice of ruling; legal 
research re applicable wage order; Emails with co-
counsel re FAC 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/5/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise Wells fargo first amended complaint; email 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/12/2017 Joshua Haffner
Legal research; Emails with defense counsel and co-
counsel 1.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/13/2017 Joshua Haffner Review removal papers; emails 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review court orders; Legal research; TC co-counsel; 
prepare letter to defense counsel; emails 7.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/15/2017 Joshua Haffner Review case precedent; emails 0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/16/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal research; emails  0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/19/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re case 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/20/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re case 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/22/2017 Joshua Haffner  Rule 26 conference 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/22/2017 Joshua Haffner
Legal research issues re class certification/overtime 
issues 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/22/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise stip 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/23/2017 Joshua Haffner

Inter-office emails Re:Wells Fargo - Stip re class 
cert, emails with co-counsel, Paul Stevens Re: Wells 
Fargo - Stipulation to continue class certification 1.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/23/2017 Joshua Haffner
Work on PMK depo notice; document demand; 
emails 2.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/26/2017 Joshua Haffner
Work on Stipulation re class cert; emails 

0.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/27/2017 Joshua Haffner
Emails and confer re stipulation to continue class 
certification 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/28/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re Initial Disclosures 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/3/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal research 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Joshua Haffner Review defendants rule 26 disclosure; emails 2.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/5/2017 Joshua Haffner Tc Paul re rule 26 disclosures, and strategize case 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/6/2017 Joshua Haffner
Revise rule 26 disclosures; review defendant 
disclosures; emails 1.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/7/2017 Joshua Haffner Joint report and stip re class cert; emails 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/11/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal research ire discovery, Duarte v. pac Specialty 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/12/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review order denying stip; legal research; TC Paul; 
emails 5.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/13/2017 Joshua Haffner
Work on discovery responses; review Vaquero 
applleate history; Tc co counsel; emails 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/14/2017 Joshua Haffner
TC Paul re stipulation; strategize; TC defense 
counsel; emails 3.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/17/2017 Joshua Haffner
Legal Research; TC Paul re stip; revise stip and 
order; TC defense counsel; emails 5.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/18/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise proposed stipulation; TC Paul; emails 1.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/20/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review order re joint report and protective order; 
emails 1.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/21/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review documents produced by defendant; Revise 
stip; TC co-counsel; emails 6.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/24/2017 Joshua Haffner TC co counsel re case; emails 1.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/25/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review order granting class cert; TC co-counsel; 
emails 0.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/26/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal research; emails 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Joshua Haffner Review defendants discovery responses; emails 2.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/28/2017 Joshua Haffner
Emails with co-counsel and office

0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with defense counsel 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/31/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise notice; TC Paul Stevens; emails 1.9 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/1/2017 Joshua Haffner
Emails with defense counsel and co-counsel re class 
notice iisues 0.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/3/2017 Joshua Haffner Review document production 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/3/2017 Joshua Haffner
Tc Paul Stevens re case; review notice and proposed 
order; emails 2.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/4/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with defense counsel re selecting mediator 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/11/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with defense counsel and co-counsel 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/13/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re mediator 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/14/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/15/2017 Joshua Haffner Email with defense counsel and co counsel 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/16/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel and office  0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on notice and proposed order; emails 4.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/19/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/21/2017 Joshua Haffner
Draft damages discovery; prepare notice of motion 
for msj; start working on msj; emails 4.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/22/2017 Joshua Haffner Review and revise discovery 1.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/22/2017 Joshua Haffner Tc Paul Stevens re case; emails 0.9 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/24/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/25/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with defense counsel and co-counsel 0.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/26/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/28/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re documents production 0.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Joshua Haffner Review court order; emails 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/30/2017 Joshua Haffner Meet with client; depo prep 3.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/30/2017 Joshua Haffner Obtain docket from Vaquero case for review; emails 1.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/31/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re case 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/5/2017 Joshua Haffner Email with co-counsel 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/6/2017 Joshua Haffner Review documents; opt and notice; emails 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/7/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re cert mailing 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/8/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re deposition 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/11/2017 Joshua Haffner Attend plaintiff depo; CF Paul 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/11/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on depo outline; review documents; emails 2.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/12/2017 Joshua Haffner
Prepare for PMK deposition; Review pleadings 
from underlying Vaquero case; emails 8.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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9/13/2017 Joshua Haffner Travel to deposition in Des Moines; prep for depo 11.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/14/2017 Joshua Haffner Take deposition; and travel back; emails 14.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/15/2017 Joshua Haffner Review final notice/opt out documents; emails 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/18/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re stipulated facts 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/19/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re class mailing 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/20/2017 Joshua Haffner
TC co-counsel re case; revise stipulated facts; 
emails 4.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/21/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review Defendants discovery responses; emails 
with defense counsel and co counsel 0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/22/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review defendants proposed stipulated facts; TC 
Paul Stevens re same; emails 1.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/25/2017 Joshua Haffner Review class administrator report; emails 0.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/26/2017 Joshua Haffner
Prepare discovery re damages; TC defense counsel 
and co-counsel; emails 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/27/2017 Joshua Haffner
Prepare damage discovery; instructions re service; 
emails 1.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/28/2017 Joshua Haffner Review stipulated facts; finalize; emails 1.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/29/2017 Joshua Haffner

Emails with defense counsel, co-counsel, claims 
adminitsrator re class mailing

0.9 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/2/2017 Joshua Haffner Outline PMK depo; emails 4.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/3/2017 Joshua Haffner

Legal research re payment of rest periods, Bluford, 
Gonzalez, Armenta; emails with co-counsel and 
defense counsel 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/4/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review Plaintiff's deposition transcript; TC Paul re 
stip; emails; work on fact section of brief 7.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/5/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise stip re facts; emails 2.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/6/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise stip; Tc Paul; emails 3.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/8/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on MSJ brief; legal research; emails 4.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on stipulated facts; emails 2.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review order on MSJ of 9/28/17 from Vaquero v. 
Ashley Furntiure; emails 2.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/11/2017 Joshua Haffner work on stip; legal research; emails 4.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise stip; TC co counsel; emails 3.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Joshua Haffner Draft MSA; TC Paul re stipulation; emails 3.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Joshua Haffner Review meet and confer letter; emails 1.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/18/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re Wells Fargo 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/19/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise stip re experts; emails 3.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/20/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on brief for MSJ; review letter; emails 5.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/23/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on MSJ; emails 6.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/24/2017 Joshua Haffner Prepare separate statement document; emails 1.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/25/2017 Joshua Haffner TC client; emails 1.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Joshua Haffner Review exhibits for stip; emails 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/27/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on brief; emails 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/30/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on  brief; TC co-counsel; emails 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/31/2017 Joshua Haffner

Inter-office emails Re: Wells Fargo; 
emails Thomas Kaufman and co-counsel, Paul 
Stevens Re: Wells Fargo; 
emails sent by Joshua Haffner Re: wells Fargo Brief 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/31/2017 Joshua Haffner Review and revise brief 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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11/1/2017 Joshua Haffner
Inter-office emails Re: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo; 
emails sent bu Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/1/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on brief and separate statement 6.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/2/2017 Joshua Haffner
Work on motion; TC Paul re motion and prior order; 
emails 2.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/3/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on MSJ brief; emails 3.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/5/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal research; emails 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/6/2017 Joshua Haffner
Work on MSJ papers (notice, motion, related 
papers); TC with Paul; emails 6.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/7/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on briefing and legal research; emails 4.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/8/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review and revise MSJ papers; review defendants' 
motion; legal research; review Nguyen; email 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/9/2017 Joshua Haffner

Email from cacd_ecfmail@cacd.uscourts.gov 
Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. et al Motion for 
Partial Summary Judgment, and Motion for 
Summary Judgment; 
email from 
ProposedOrder_DoNotReply@cacd.uscourts.gov 
Proposed Orders (Confirmation): 17-cv-04344-PA-
ASx; 
inter-office emails Re: Wells Fargo, Final filing for 
today, and Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS 
Patricia Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. et al 
Motion for Summary Judgment; 
emails with co-counsel, Paul Stevens Re: Wells 
Fargo Final filing for today, Wells Fargo filing for 
tomorrow re: Proposed Order, and Statement of 
Uncontroverted Facts
emails sent by Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo Opp, 
Wells Fargo, and Wells Fargo filing for tomorrow; 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/9/2017 Joshua Haffner Finalize briefing; calls; emails 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/10/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with cocounsel 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/13/2017 Joshua Haffner TC Tom; TC Paul; emails 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/14/2017 Joshua Haffner Research; work on brief; emails 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/15/2017 Joshua Haffner
Legal research; TC Paul; work on opp to motion; 
emails 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/16/2017 Joshua Haffner
Legal research and brief opp to MSJ, including 
Prachasaisoradej ; emails 5.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/17/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on opp to MSJ; calls, emails 7.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/20/2017 Joshua Haffner Continue drafting opp and sep statement; emails 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/21/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails re case 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/22/2017 Joshua Haffner Revise opposition brief 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/23/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/24/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel re opposition 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/27/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/28/2017 Joshua Haffner Opp to MSJ brief; emails 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/29/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on opp to MSJ; emails 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/30/2017 Joshua Haffner
TC Paul; legal research re advance; work on 
spearate statement; emails 2.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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12/1/2017 Joshua Haffner
Work on opp to MSJ and separate statement and 
related documents; calls and emails 8.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/4/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review defendants papers; research; TC Paul; 
emails 3.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/5/2017 Joshua Haffner Finalize briefing; emails 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/6/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails and calls with counsel counsel 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/7/2017 Joshua Haffner Research and emails re rply brief 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on reply brief; emails 3.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/10/2017 Joshua Haffner Review claims administartor report 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/12/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on brief; TC expert and co-counsel; emails 5.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/13/2017 Joshua Haffner Work on reply brief; emails 3.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel re experts 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/15/2017 Joshua Haffner Emails with cocounsel 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/18/2017 Joshua Haffner Review defendants reply brief; finalize reply; emails 6.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal Research; emails 4.9 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Joshua Haffner Legal Research; emails 4.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/21/2017 Joshua Haffner
Analysis of commission documents; emails with 
defense counsel and co counsel 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/22/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/26/2017 Joshua Haffner
Review claims administrator report; emails re case

0.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/29/2017 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/2/2018 Joshua Haffner

Review claims administrator report; emails with 
experts

0.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/3/2018 Joshua Haffner
Tc expert re damage analysis; TC Jim Gallup; 
emails 2.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/4/2018 Joshua Haffner TC expert; emails 2.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/5/2018 Joshua Haffner Review claims administrator report; emails 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/6/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/8/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re case 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/11/2018 Joshua Haffner Review class member list 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/12/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re Class List 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/16/2018 Joshua Haffner
Work on expert analysis; emails with expert and co-
counsel; review claims administrator report 1.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/17/2018 Joshua Haffner Meet with coc-ounsel; TC Tom Kaufman; emails 3.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails mails re case 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/21/2018 Joshua Haffner Review claims administartor report 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/22/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Joshua Haffner Review order on MSJ; TC Paul Stevens; emails 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Joshua Haffner Meeting with co counsel; emails 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/25/2018 Joshua Haffner
TC co-counsel; emails with defense counsel and co-
counsel 1.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/26/2018 Joshua Haffner
Emails with defense counseland co-counsel re 
mediation; review proposedmediator 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/29/2018 Joshua Haffner
Legals research; TC expert and Paul; review order to 
continue dates; emails 8.8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/30/2018 Joshua Haffner
Legal research re regular rate of pay; calls and 
emails 5.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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1/31/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/1/2018 Joshua Haffner
Legal research; work on pre trial orders; TC defense 
counsel; TC Paul re mediation/status; emails 8.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/2/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/3/2018 Joshua Haffner Email fre case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/4/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails from with co-counsel 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/4/2018 Joshua Haffner Send letters re case 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/5/2018 Joshua Haffner
Prepare designation of expert witnesses; review 
report; emails 4.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/6/2018 Joshua Haffner
TC Paul re case; TC expert; work on stipulation; 
work on expert designation; emails 3.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/7/2018 Joshua Haffner
Review Wells Fargo's expert report re damages; 
work on stip re damages; emails 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/8/2018 Joshua Haffner
Email with defense counsel and cocounselre stip as 
to damges 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/9/2018 Joshua Haffner

Work on stipulation re damages/review expert 
reports; TC defense counsel and cocounsel re 
stipulation; emails 5.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/11/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re expert and stip 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Joshua Haffner Revise stip; TC cocounsel; emails 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/13/2018 Joshua Haffner
Review order; legal research; revise stip for 
damages; emails 4.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/14/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/15/2018 Joshua Haffner
Review order approving stip; TC co counsel re 
briefing; emails 1.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/20/2018 Joshua Haffner Legal research; work damage trial brief; emails 5.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/23/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re case 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/25/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/27/2018 Joshua Haffner
Legal research; work on damages brief; request for 
judicial notice; emails 4.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/28/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel re damages 0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/1/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on damages brief; legal research 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/2/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel, review damages issues 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/5/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re Wells Fargo 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/6/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on brief re damages 5.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/7/2018 Joshua Haffner
Legal research; work on draft of brief; TC co 
counsel; emails 5.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/8/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on damages brief; emails 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2018 Joshua Haffner Revise mediation brief; TC Paul; email 2.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/12/2018 Joshua Haffner Email sent by Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Joshua Haffner Revise mediation brief; damages brief; emails 6.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/14/2018 Joshua Haffner
Work on damages brief; legal research; request for 
judicial notice; emails 11.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/15/2018 Joshua Haffner Revise trial brief; emails 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/16/2018 Joshua Haffner

Revise RJN; legal research; Revise Conclusions of 
Law and Fact; Go to court for final pre trial 
conference; court closed; finalize documents 9.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/19/2018 Joshua Haffner
Emails with defense counsel and cocounselre trial, 
findings of fact, mediation 0.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/20/2018 Joshua Haffner Prepare for meidation; emails 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2018 Joshua Haffner TC Paul re mediation/status 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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3/21/2018 Joshua Haffner
Travel to SF for mediation; attend mediation; meet 
with co-counsel; travel back 14.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/22/2018 Joshua Haffner  Work on response brief legal research 3.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re damages trial and briefing 0.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/27/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on response trial brief; emails 8.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/28/2018 Joshua Haffner

Work on response trial brief; response to 
order/conclusions of fact and law; legal research; 
emails 6.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/29/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on Response brief; TC co-counsel; emails 4.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2018 Joshua Haffner
Revise and finalize plaintiff response brief; review 
Wells Fargo's response brief; emails 6.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/2/2018 Joshua Haffner Prep for trial; emails 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on power point for trial; emails 4.7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/4/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on power point for trial; emails 5.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/5/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on power point; review court order; emails 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/6/2018 Joshua Haffner

Work on power point pre revisions requested by 
Tom; Review order re attorney's fees motion; TC 
Paul re same; emails 3.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/9/2018 Joshua Haffner Cf Paul re motion for attorney fees; emails 1.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re case costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/12/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re Discovery Responses 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/13/2018 Joshua Haffner Legal research 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/18/2018 Joshua Haffner Email re case 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/23/2018 Joshua Haffner Legal research; emails 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Joshua Haffner
Review court order re attorney fees motion/ legal 
research 2.0 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/24/2018 Joshua Haffner Legal research; emails 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/25/2018 Joshua Haffner
Legal research; TC Paul re atty fees in wage and 
hour cases; CF staff; emails 3.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/26/2018 Joshua Haffner
Work on attorney fee, meet and confer; TC co-
counsel re case 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/27/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re case; joint statement 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/29/2018 Joshua Haffner
Emails with defense counsel and co-counsel re meet 
and confer 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/1/2018 Joshua Haffner
Emails re attorneys fees claim with defense counsel 
and co-counsel 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/1/2018 Joshua Haffner TC defense counsel and co-counsel 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re case and motion 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/4/2018 Joshua Haffner
Emails and call with defense counsel re bond, atty 
fees, appeal 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/9/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re case; order 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/9/2018 Joshua Haffner Review order on damages; TC co-counsel; emails 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re case, order, motion 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on motion for attorney fees 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/11/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re bond and cost bill 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/12/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re motion for attys fees 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/14/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re bond and legal research 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/14/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on motion for atty fees; legal research 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re motion, new potential opt in 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2018 Joshua Haffner Obtain and review motion from sample case 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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5/16/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re calendering; appeal brief; motion 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/16/2018 Joshua Haffner
Review defendant's mediation questionairre on 
appeal 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/16/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on brief; legal research; TC co-counsel 5.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/17/2018 Joshua Haffner
Emails re appeal briefing schedule and motion and 
costs 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/17/2018 Joshua Haffner Research and work on motion 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/18/2018 Joshua Haffner
Emails with defense counsel and co counsel re 
motion and bond 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/21/2018 Joshua Haffner Drafting of motion 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/21/2018 Joshua Haffner
Emails with defense counsel and co counsel re bond 
and motion 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/21/2018 Joshua Haffner Research re filing cost bill 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/21/2018 Joshua Haffner TC co counsel re bond 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/22/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails with co-counsel and staff re cost bill; filing 0.4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/23/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails re motion for attorney fees 0.2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/23/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on motion for atty fee 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2018 Joshua Haffner Revise motion; emails 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/28/2018 Joshua Haffner
Work on motion; research re class repr award; 
emails 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/29/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on motion; emails 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/31/2018 Joshua Haffner Meet with co-counsel; work on brief 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/1/2018 Joshua Haffner Legal research; emails 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/2/2018 Joshua Haffner
Review studies re fee awards; work on brief; review 
response on Bond and emails 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/8/2018 Joshua Haffner Work on Motion for attorney fees\class rep award 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/11/2018 Joshua Haffner Emails with Co-counsel re: case 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2018 Joshua Haffner
Work on Motion for Fees and Class Rep Award and 
Proposed Order; emails 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/15/2018 Joshua Haffner
Draft Declaration re: motion for fees; revisions to 
motion; conference with co-counsel and emails  5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Necessary and reasonable
Necessary and reasonable
Necessary and reasonable

TOTAL: 690.6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
Necessary and reasonable

1/10/2017 Paul Stevens Phone call with Patricia Barreras  2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/12/2017 Paul Stevens Phone call with Patricia Barreras  1.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/17/2017 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2017 Paul Stevens Phone call with Patricia Barreras  0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/22/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/22/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/20/2017 Paul Stevens Meet Patricia and Jackie Ibarra in Pasadena  4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/21/2017 Paul Stevens Phone call with Jackie Ibarra re: potential lawsuit  1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/28/2017 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/8/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Stevens LC Retainer Agreement Patricia 
Barreras  

1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/9/2017 Paul Stevens Follow up meeting with co-counsel  2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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3/9/2017 Paul Stevens meeting with clients  3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/10/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Retainer Document for Jackie Ibarra  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/10/2017 Paul Stevens Follow up conf call with Plaintiffs   1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: draft complaint 0.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Complaint (state)  6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2017 Paul Stevens Meeting with Patricia Barrerras Jackie Ibarra and 

Josh
4

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Handybook-Filed-Complaint 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2017 Paul Stevens Review  PATRICIA BARRERA Agreement 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2017 Paul Stevens Wells Fargo Complaint PDS Edit  2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Wells Fargo Complaint FINAL 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargp 

class action
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/21/2017 Paul Stevens research the off the clock overtime claims  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/22/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/22/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/22/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2017 Paul Stevens Call with co counsel Josh Haffner 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner CA Sprm Court 

decision on arbitration
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: CA Sprm 

Court decision on arbitration
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: CA Sprm 

Court decision on arbitration
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/12/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert FW: Barreras v. 

WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert FW: Barreras v. 

WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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4/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Barreras v. WF 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: 
Barreras v. WF

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: 
Barreras v. WF

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray FW: Barreras v. 
WF

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras v. 
WF

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 
Barreras v. WF

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 
Barreras v. WF

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/17/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: propoer defendant 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Tom Kaufman re: proper defendant in 

action
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barreras v. 

WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barreras v. 

WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras v. 

WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: 

Barreras v. WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/17/2017 Paul Stevens Read various cases re: jurisdiction of Wells Fargo 1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Barreras v. 

WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Barreras v. WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - first 

amended complaint 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo -

first amended complaint 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: arbitration issues 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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4/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 
Berkowitz RE: Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate

0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Article 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo -- 

FAC
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

FAC
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/1/2017 Paul Stevens Call w Josh re: FAC 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/1/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Dec in Support of Request for Dismissal WF 1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/1/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Request for Dismissal and accompanying 

Docs (state)  
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/1/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Stevens Dec in Support of Request for 

Dismissal WF 
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Dec in Support 

of Request for Dismissal Wells Fargo.doc
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/1/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Dec in 

Support of Request for Dismissal Wells Fargo.doc
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz 

Automatic reply: Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/5/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: potential settlement scenarios 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/8/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Initial Status Conference Brief 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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5/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: demand letter 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2017 Paul Stevens Correspondence  Draft Barreras v Wells Fargo 

proposed resolution Ltr
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v Wells 

Fargo 5-10-17 Ltr.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2017 Paul Stevens Work on Ltr to Counsel re Proposed Resolution  4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/11/2017 Paul Stevens Correspondence  Draft Barreras v Wells Fargo Ltr 0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz RE: Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray; Paul Berkowitz; 

Joshua Haffner; Thomas Kaufman RE: Barreras 
Agreement to Arbitrate

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS   Document 62-4   Filed 06/18/18   Page 22 of 115   Page ID
 #:1369



5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 
Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 
Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 
Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/15/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Maisha 
McCray; Joshua Haffner; Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2017 Paul Stevens Work on Joint Report (state)  3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens  Work on Joint Initial Status Conference Statement 

(state) 
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo - 

problem
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray FW: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/16/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/18/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: Amended Complaint 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS   Document 62-4   Filed 06/18/18   Page 23 of 115   Page ID
 #:1370



5/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/22/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Dec and Proposed Order Request for 
Dismissal WF 

2
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/23/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: substituting D and initial status 
conference

0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo - 
dismissal

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2017 Paul Stevens Appear Initial Status conference (State Court)  2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Vaquero 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo -- 

amended complaint
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo -- 

amended complaint
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

amended complaint
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo status 

conference
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/24/2017 Paul Stevens Met with Josh re: status conferenc, issues 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Vaquero 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Vaquero 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/2/2017 Paul Stevens Draft edit FAC 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: 

FAC_IbarraPDS edit.doc
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wELLS fARGO 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

FAC
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo -- FAC 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Barreras 

Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Barreras Agreement to Arbitrate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Superlawyers 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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6/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: Wells 
Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz FW: Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/12/2017 Paul Stevens Review ANSWER to Amended Complaint  0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/12/2017 Paul Stevens Review NOTICE OF REMOVAL from Los Angeles 

Superior Court  
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344 Patricia Barreras  v. Wells 
Fargo Bank N.A. et al Answer to Complaint 
(Discovery)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner re: Notice of 

Assignment
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner re: Vaquero v. 

Ashley Furniture Industries Inc.
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/13/2017 Paul Stevens Review NOTICE OF ASSIGNMENT   0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/13/2017 Paul Stevens Review STANDING ORDER by Judge Percy 

Anderson:   
0.75

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens  Draft Ex Parte App for ext of class cert 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens  Review  Order on Ex Parte MCC 0.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: case 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens Correspondence  Draft Barreras v Wells Fargo Ltr 0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 

potential mediators
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: 

Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens Orders Review  Scheduleing Order 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/14/2017 Paul Stevens Orders Review  Standing Order 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/15/2017 Paul Stevens Review  D's Notice of Removal 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/15/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Ex. A - Complaint 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/15/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Ex. B - FAC 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/15/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Ex. C - D's Answer to Complaint 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Huntington 

Memorial Hosp. v. Superior Court
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Notice of 

Removal
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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6/16/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: 
Notice of Removal

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/16/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: 
Notice of Removal

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Notice of 
Removal

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Notice of 
Removal

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/19/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: 
Notice of Removal

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/23/2017 Paul Stevens Draft P's Demand for Production of Documents Set 
One and P's Notice of Deposition of Wells Fargo   

2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert Wells Fargo - 

Stipulation to continue class certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo - 

Stipulation to continue class certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Laert RE: [Wells Fargo] - 

Defs NOD of Jacqueline Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: [Wells 

Fargo] - Defs NOD of Jacqueline Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: [Wells Fargo] -

Defs NOD of Jacqueline Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: [Wells Fargo] 

- Defs NOD of Jacqueline Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: Ibarra 

v. Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo -

Stipulation to continue class certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Fargo -

Stipulation to continue class certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: New class 

case scenario (adv. Target)
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: New class 

case scenario (adv. Target)
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: New class case 

scenario (adv. Target)
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Target 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Target 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: Ibarra 

v. Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: R26 disclosures 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Draft P's Notice of Depos of WF 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Article on Tom 

Swanson of Wells Fargo 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Barrerras v. 

Wells Fargo - Initial Disclosures 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Barrerras v. 

Wells Fargo - Initial Disclosures 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barrerras v. 

Wells Fargo - Initial Disclosures 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barrerras v. 

Wells Fargo - Initial Disclosures 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Email Plaintiff re Wells Fargo Notice of Deposition 

and Request for Production of Documents  
0.75

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Propounded by Plaintiff  Draft P's Demand for 

Production of Docs set1
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Review  WF Amended Notice of Depo 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Review and draft  Pltf Intial Disclosures 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Review revise Initial Disclosures v2  0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Review revise Wells Fargo Initial Disclosures  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Review WF RFPs  0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/5/2017 Paul Stevens Revise Initial Disclosures v3  0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barrerras v. 

Wells Fargo - Initial Disclosures 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Barrerras v. 

Wells Fargo - Initial Disclosures 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Paul Stevens initial Disclosures Review  Wells Fargo Initial 

Disclosures FINAL
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Paul Stevens Meeting of Counsel  0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Paul Stevens Review P's Initial Disclosures   0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Paul Stevens work on Joint Rule 26(f) Report   2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/6/2017 Paul Stevens Work on Joint Stip. To Cont'd Hearing Date on P's 

Motion for Class Cert.  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Paul Stevens Draft JOINT RULE 26(f) REPORT  2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: Ibarra 

v. Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: Ibarra 

v. Wells Fargo - Stipulation re Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Paul Stevens Joint STIPULATION to Continue Motion for Class 

Certification  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Paul Stevens REPORT of JOINT RULE 26(f) REPORT filed  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/7/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs produced by Plaintiff  5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Frago 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Wells Frago 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Frago 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Frago 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Frago 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/11/2017 Paul Stevens Work on Draft of Responses to Wells Fargo's 

Request for Documents and Deposition of 
Jacqueline Ibarra  

2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: denial of stip[ to cont class cert 

deadline
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Lambert RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Activity in 
Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/13/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: Vaquero v. Stoneledge 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Plaintiff's 

response to Wells Fargo Bank's Request for 
Production of Documents - Set One.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Plaintiff's 

response to Wells Fargo Bank's Request for 
Production of Documents - Set One.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens Calls with Josh re: stipualtion to class certification 0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call Counsel for Wells Fargo re: 

stipulation to dismiss certain claims, certifiy certain 
claims

0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Proposed 

Stip for Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Proposed 

Stip for Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo - 

Pls get this documents from LASC Case No. 
BC522676

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo - 

Pls get this documents from LASC Case No. 
BC522676

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - Pls 

get this documents from LASC Case No. BC522676
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - Pls 

get this documents from LASC Case No. BC522676
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/15/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call Counsel for Wells Fargo re: 

stipulation to dismiss certain claims, certifiy certain 
claims

0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/17/2017 Paul Stevens call with Josh re: revising stipulation class 

certification
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/17/2017 Paul Stevens call with Tom Kaufman re: stipulation class 
certification

0.25
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Stipulation, moving paeprs for class 
certification, proposed Order 

7.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Proposed Stip 
for Ibarra/Barreras

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Proposed Stip 
for Ibarra/Barreras

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Sample federal 
motion for prelim a pproval

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Sample federal 
motion for prelim a pproval

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Stip to certify class 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Stip to certify class 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Stip to certify class 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Stip to certify class 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Defendant's RFP

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Defendant's RFP

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Defendant's RFP

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Proposed Stip for Ibarra/Barreras

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Proposed Stip for Ibarra/Barreras

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Proposed Stip for Ibarra/Barreras

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Proposed Stip for Ibarra/Barreras

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Proposed Stip for Ibarra/Barreras

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 
Haffner RE: Defendant's RFP

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 
Haffner RE: Proposed Stip for Ibarra/Barreras

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens call with Josh re: revising stipulation class 

certification
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Joint 

Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Joint 

Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Joint 

Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Joint 
Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Joint 
Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Joint 
Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Joint 
Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Joint 

Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Proposed Order Re Class Cert.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Proposed Order Re Class Cert.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Joint Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Joint Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/19/2017 Paul Stevens review court's protective order re: confidential 

information  
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/19/2017 Paul Stevens Review protective order re: confidential information 0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/19/2017 Paul Stevens Work on Ameded Stip.  to Certify Class Cert of P's 

Rest Break Claims and Briefing Schedule for Rule 
56 Motion  

5.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Minutes of In Chaers 
Order/Directive - no proceeding held

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Minutes of In Chaers 
Order/Directive - no proceeding held

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Joint 

Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Joint 

Stipulated Motion for Class certification.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - 

selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - 

selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo - 

selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo - 

selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/20/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Order Denying Stip. to Con't Hearing Date 0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/20/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Protective Order 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens Review Civil Trial Sched Order  1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/20/2017 Paul Stevens Revise Joint Stip to Certify Class Cert of P's Rest 

Break Claims and Briefing Schedule for Rule 56 
Motion  

4

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens call with Josh re: stipulation class certification 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS   Document 62-4   Filed 06/18/18   Page 32 of 115   Page ID
 #:1379



7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Stip 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Stip 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman FW: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation 
to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman FW: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Stipulation 
to Certify

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens call with Josh re: claims 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens Conf Call with Jackie Ibarra re: document requests 1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Employee class 

action waivers
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Employee class 

action waivers
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo - 

Pls get this documents from LASC Case No. 
BC522676

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo - 

Pls get this documents from LASC Case No. 
BC522676

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: Ibarra 

v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: Ibarra 
v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Joshua 
Haffner; Thomas Kaufman RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman; Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo 
selecting mediator

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting 
mediator

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens Meet with clients re: Desfendants deposition notice 

and RFPs  
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/24/2017 Paul Stevens Review Wells Fargo's Objections and Responses to 

P's Demand for Production of Documents Set One 
and Notice of Deposition of PMK  

1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Paul Stevens call with Jaqueline Ibarra re: Class Certification  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Paul Stevens call with Josh re: class cert 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Available 

dates for Jeffrey Krivis
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Available dates for Jeffrey Krivis
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz; Joshua Haffner FW: Available dates for 
Jeffrey Krivis

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Paul Stevens Review Order Certifying Class and Scheduling  0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Paul Stevens review order granting class certification  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Paul Stevens Work with Plaintff Jaquel;ine Ibarra on Document 

Requests  
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Joint Notice of Selection of Private Mediator  1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Available 

dates for Jeffrey Krivis
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Exemplar 

class notice.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 
Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Available 

dates for Jeffrey Krivis
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - 

Vaquero briefing
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz FW: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Available dates for Jeffrey Krivis
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Septeer 

Depo Dates in Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz FW: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting 
mediator

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz; Joshua Haffner RE: Available dates for 
Jeffrey Krivis

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 
Berkowitz; Joshua Haffner RE: Available dates for 
Jeffrey Krivis

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  

facebook 2016-present
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  

Jackies Instagram 
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Paul Stevens Review Vaquero v Stoneledge, Trial Court Docs 

Vaquero
3.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Motion Re Class Notice  3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Class Notice 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Class Notice 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Class Notice 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Class Notice 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/27/2017 Paul Stevens Review Class Notice Court's Order  0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Joint Stip Motion for Notice Plan 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray (via Dropbox) 

Maisha McCray shared "Docs Produced" with you
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Septeer 

Depo Dates in Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Class Notice 
and Depos

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra Class 

Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS   Document 62-4   Filed 06/18/18   Page 37 of 115   Page ID
 #:1384



7/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra Class 
Notice

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz Re: Ibarra 

v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Ibarra 

Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Ibarra 

Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/29/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  

Facebook Profile Pages Cont'd 
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/30/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - 

Vaquero breifing
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/31/2017 Paul Stevens call with Josh re: class notice and other issues 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/31/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Draft Class Notice Redline with opt our 
form.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/31/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Wells 

Fargo Draft Class Notice Redline with opt our 
form.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/31/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/31/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Wells Fargo Draft Class Notice Redline 
with opt our form.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra - Class 

Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 

Class Notice 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/1/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman FW: 

Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/1/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/1/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/2/2017 Paul Stevens Class Notice  Draft Proposed Order Re Stip/Motion 

for Notice Plan
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/2/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/2/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/2/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/2/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review  WF Bank's Objections/Re to P's Demands 

for Production of Docs  Set One
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  

Downey Contact List
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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8/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  
Emails from Supervisors

0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  Fast 
mail 

0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  
HMC Incentive Plan

2
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff, Retail Finance 
Bonus/Comission reports 

2
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff, Texts from Supervisors 0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/3/2017 Paul Stevens call with Josh re: class notice and discovery  0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens call with Josh re: class notice and discovery  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens Class Notice  Draft Exhibit 2 - to Stip and Joint 

Motion CPT CV
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens Class Notice  Review  CPT Bid 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens Draft discovery response and objections to depo 

notice  
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email CPT for CV for Motion  0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting 
mediator

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Timothy Phillips CV 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Timothy Phillips CV 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Timothy Phillips Re: 

Case: Ibarra v Wells Fargo - Post Certification 
Mailing

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens email WF counsel re: discovery and class notice 

motion  
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens Review Docs Produced By WF 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/3/2017 Paul Stevens Review WF Bank's Objections/Re to P's Notice of 

Depo of PMK and Request for Prod. of Docs  
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Docs 

Produced By WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Docs Produced 

By WF
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/4/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/4/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  

PL000001-000211_Part2
0.75

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/4/2017 Paul Stevens Review Docs Produced By WF Review  Doc 

Produced by Def 1
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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8/5/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  
PL000001-000211_Part3

0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/5/2017 Paul Stevens Review Docs Produced By WF Review  Doc 
Produced by Def 3

1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/5/2017 Paul Stevens Review The Different Elements of HMC 
Compensation  

1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/6/2017 Paul Stevens Class Notice  Draft Joint Stip/Motion Notice Plan 
Revised

2
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/6/2017 Paul Stevens Discovery Review  Plaintiff's Re to WF Bank's 
NOTICE OF DEPO

0.25
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/6/2017 Paul Stevens Work on Joint Stip for Order Approving Class 
Notice   

1.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/7/2017 Paul Stevens  review Plaintiff's Re to WF Bank's Request for 
Production of Doc - Set One

0.25
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/7/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  
PL000001-000211

0.75
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/8/2017 Paul Stevens Review docs from Plaintiff to produce Review  
PL000001-000211_Part1

0.75
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/10/2017 Paul Stevens Review the Compensation Plans That Governed 
HMC Compensation  

3
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/15/2017 Paul Stevens Class Notice  Draft Exhibit 1 - Stip and Joint 
Motion

1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/15/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Declaration for 
Class Notice and Scheduling Depositions  

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/15/2017 Paul Stevens finalize Joint Stipulation for Order approving class 

notice filed by Plaintiff Jacqueline F. Ibarra. 
(Attachments: # 1 Exhibit 1 # 2 Exhibit 2 
# 3 Proposed Order  

4

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/17/2017 Paul Stevens Draft stipulation and proposed order re: class notice 

proposed notices   
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra - Class 

Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra - Class 

Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner; Paul Berkowitz; 

Thomas Kaufman RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner; Thomas Kaufman 
RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Depo Dates

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: [Wells Fargo] 

- L/D to designate experts & Provide reports 
required by Fed R Civ 26(a)(2)(B)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra - Class 

Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: wells fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman FW: Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman FW: Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Paul Berkowitz; Thomas 

Kaufman RE: Ibarra - Class Notice
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/21/2017 Paul Stevens  Review Draft Sprogs Set 1 PDS 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo -- 

damages discovery
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Bermudez v 

Ashley Furniture
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

damages discovery
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/22/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: Ibarra 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/22/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/23/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Stip/Joint App Class Notice  Exhibit 1 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/23/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Stip/Joint App Class Notice  Exhibit 2 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/23/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Stip/Joint App Class Notice  Stip App Class 

Notice
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner; Thomas Kaufman; 

Paul Berkowitz RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray FW: [Nguyen v 

Wells Fargo] - Motion for Class Certification
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/24/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/24/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Nguyen - Declaration Wynne 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/24/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Nguyen MTC 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/24/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Ngyen Wells MTC 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Your Flight 

Receipt - JOSHUA H HAFFNER 13SEP17
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Court Reporter 

Idea for Iowa
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Court 
Reporter Idea for Iowa

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Court 
Reporter Idea for Iowa

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra v. 
Wells Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Court 
Reporter Idea for Iowa

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Court Reporter Idea for Iowa

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - pls 
calendar 

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo - 

pls calendar 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Plaintiff's Depo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Plaintiff's Depo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/28/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz Plaintiff's Depo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/28/2017 Paul Stevens Review  WF Amended Notice of Depo 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/28/2017 Paul Stevens Review ORDER APPROVING CLASS NOTICE  

Review ORDER APPROVING CLASS NOTICE  
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Case: Ibarra v 

Wells Fargo - Post Certification Mailing
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Canceled: [Wells 

Fargo] - Defs NOD of Plaintiff Jacqueline Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/29/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Timothy Phillips Re: 

Case: Ibarra v Wells Fargo - Post Certification 
Mailing

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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8/30/2017 Paul Stevens Class Notice  Draft Exhibit 1 - Wells Fargo Final 
Class Notice

2
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/30/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v. 
Wells Fargo

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/30/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/30/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Paul Berkowitz; 

gl@haffnerlawyers.com; jhh@haffnerlawyers.com; 
Thomas Kaufman; Josie Lopez; Praveeta Garcia; 
Maisha McCray; Graham Lambert RE: Ibarra v. 
Wells Fargo

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
8/30/2017 Paul Stevens Meeting Jackie Ibarra preparation for deposition 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/3/2017 Paul Stevens   Prepare client Jaqueline for deposition 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Case: Ibarra v 

Wells Fargo - Post Certification Mailing
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Case: Ibarra v 

Wells Fargo - Post Certification Mailing
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Hotel for 

Wells Fargo Deposition
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/6/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Case: Ibarra v Wells Fargo - Post Certification 
Mailing

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/6/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Case: Ibarra v Wells Fargo - Post Certification 
Mailing

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/6/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; 

Maisha McCray RE: Case: Ibarra v Wells Fargo - 
Post Certification Mailing

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Hotel for 

Wells Fargo Deposition
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/10/2017 Paul Stevens   Prepare client Jaqueline for deposition 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/11/2017 Paul Stevens Appearance deposition of Jaqueline Ibarra 2.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mailing Documents for Review/Approval
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/11/2017 Paul Stevens travel to and from deposition of Jaqueline Ibarra 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Delta Air Lines 

flight 3613 to Des Moines (GJ86P6)
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Documents for 
Review/Approval

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Documents for 
Review/Approval

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/12/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Kelsey 

Skey; Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - 
Mailing Documents for Review/Approval

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/12/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Thomas Kaufman; 

Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing 
Documents for Review/Approval

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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9/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - Mailing Documents for Review/Approval

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mailing Documents for Review/Approval
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Documents for 
Review/Approval

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/13/2017 Paul Stevens travel to Iowa for deposition Wells Fargo PMK 

Mark Faktor 
10

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/14/2017 Paul Stevens Attend Deposition of WF PMK MARK FAKTOR 

(in Iowa)
4

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Start time?
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Start 

time?
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/14/2017 Paul Stevens travel from Iowa for deposition Wells Fargo PMK 

Mark Faktor 
8

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/15/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Joshua Haffner; 

Paul Berkowitz; Thomas Kaufman; Josie Lopez; 
Maisha McCray; Graham Laert; Praveeta Garcia RE:
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Documents for 
Review/Approval

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman First 

Crack at Proposed Stipulated Facts for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/18/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner Re: First Crack at Proposed Stipulated Facts 
for Ibarra

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/18/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Joshua Haffner; 

Paul Berkowitz; Thomas Kaufman; Josie Lopez; 
Maisha McCray; Graham Laert; Praveeta Garcia Re: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/19/2017 Paul Stevens Orders Review  Order Granting Stip/Motion for an 

Order Approving Class Notice
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens Call w\Josh re: case, stipulated facts 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: URGENT: 

Wells Fargo Employment Rest Break Class Action
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: First Crack at 

Proposed Stipulated Facts for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo - 

stip facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - stip 

facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Joshua Haffner; 
Paul Berkowitz; Thomas Kaufman; Josie Lopez; 
Maisha McCray; Graham Laert; Praveeta Garcia RE:
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Joshua Haffner; 

Paul Berkowitz; Thomas Kaufman; Josie Lopez; 
Maisha McCray; Graham Laert; Praveeta Garcia RE:
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/20/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Stip facts Comments 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Class Mmeber 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens call with member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Stip 

facts.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Stip facts.docx 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Stip facts.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Stip 

facts.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Stip facts.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Stip facts.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/21/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/22/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: Defendant's proposed stipulated 

facts for MSJs
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/22/2017 Paul Stevens call with member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/22/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Nguyen v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/22/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Accepted: Conference call to discuss Ibarra facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/22/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/22/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/22/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/23/2017 Paul Stevens call with member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/23/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/23/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/23/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/24/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/25/2017 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/26/2017 Paul Stevens Calls with Tom Kaufman, co-counsel re: stipulated 

facts
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Billing 

Records
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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9/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo class 
action retainer

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 
damage discovery

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

9/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Revised Ibarra Stipulated Facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/28/2017 Paul Stevens Draft section California Has A Strong Public Policy 

Favoring Protection Of Workers’ General Welfare.  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/28/2017 Paul Stevens Review arguments re: Armenta v. Osmose Inc. 135 

Cal.App.4th 314 (2005)  
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/28/2017 Paul Stevens Review Bluford v. Safeway Stores Inc. 216 Cal. 

App. 4th 864 (2013)  
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/28/2017 Paul Stevens Review Vaquero v. Stoneledge 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Class notice Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/29/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Class Notice Mailing 
Confirmation

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/29/2017 Paul Stevens Review Bradescu v. Hillstone Rest. Group Inc. 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
9/29/2017 Paul Stevens Review Brum v. Marketsource Inc. 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo PMk 

tetsimony
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review and designate depo transcript  testiminy 

PMK of Wells Fargo - Mark Faktor for MSJ
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing 
Confirmation

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Def Stoneledge's Memo of P&A ISO MSJ 1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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10/3/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Defs Stoneledge Furniture Opp to MSJ 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Defs Stoneledge Reply iSO MSJ. 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Order in Stoneledge denying MSJ. 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Pltfs Memo of P&A ISO opp to MSJ 

Vaquero
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/3/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Pltfs Reply to Defs Opp to MSJ Vaquero 1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/4/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: stipulated facts 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Stip facts 

PDS revisions (003).docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells - Issue 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/4/2017 Paul Stevens Review   Depostion  IBARRA.JACQUELINE 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens  Revise Stip[ulated Separate Statement  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens Depo Transcript  Draft Declaration & Errata Sheet - 

Jacqueline Ibarra v. WF Ban
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells - Issue 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo stip 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Ibarra 

Stipulated Facts - TRK 10/5 Redline
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra Stipulated Facts - TRK 10/5 Redline
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra Stipulated Facts - TRK 10/5 Redline
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Mailing Confirmation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/5/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Stip facts PDS 2 revisions 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/6/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: stipulated facts 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra 

Stipulated Facts - TRK 10/5 Redline
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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10/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells stip 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/6/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-7-17
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-7-17
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-7-17
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-7-17
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman TRK 

Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-7-17
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner Re: TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-
7-17

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/7/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner Re: TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-
7-17

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/7/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/8/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Advancing 

dates on MSJ
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Minutes of In Chaers 
Order/Directive - no proceeding held

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Advancing 

dates on MSJ
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Exemplar 

Ibarra Wage Statement For Our Call
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo my 

revisions
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Advancing dates on MSJ
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Exemplar Ibarra Wage Statement For Our Call
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Final 

(?) Version of Stip Facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman FW: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Minutes of 
In Chaers Order/Directive - no proceeding held

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Minutes of 
In Chambers Order/Directive - no proceeding held

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-7-17

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-7-17

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/9/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
TRK Revision to Stipulated Facts for 10-7-17

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/9/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 
Motions Summary Judgement  

1.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 
Stipulated Facts Final.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Final (?) 
Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Stip on Damages Discovery Dates

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Stip on Damages Discovery Dates

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Stip on 
Damages Discovery Dates

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Wells 
Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/10/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 
Haffner Re: Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/10/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/11/2017 Paul Stevens Conf Call Haffner review Commision Reports and 

Pay Voucher for inclusion in separate statement   
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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10/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 
Stipulated Facts Final.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/11/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 
Stipulated Facts Final.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 
Haffner RE: Final (?) Version of Stip Facts

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/11/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Final (?) Version of Stip Facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/12/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: stipulated facts 0.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens Con call Josh Haffner Re Stipulated facts and 

Separate Statement   
0.75

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens Edit Separate Statement paragraghs 35 and 39  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 

Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 

Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 
Haffner RE: Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Wells Fargo Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens Email Tom Kaufamn re: Separate Statement  0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ2 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Review  Stipulated Facts Exhibit 5 - WFHM 

Retail Finance - Bonus & Commission Reports 
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens Prepare Exhibts 5 and 6 to Separate Statement   0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/13/2017 Paul Stevens Review Docs Produced By WF Review  Stipulated 

Facts Exhibt 6
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/14/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/15/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: stipulated facts 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Graham Laert RE: wells fargo -- 

sprogs set two
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo -- 

sprogs set two
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/16/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Pltfs Memo of P&A ISO MSJ  2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Proposed Order re: MSJ  3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Expert 

Disclosures in Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/17/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Economist 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Expert 

Disclosures in Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/18/2017 Paul Stevens Review and draft Stipulated Facts  0.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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10/18/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 
Motions Summary Judgement  

1.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/19/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Joint Stip. For Modified Schedulung Involving 
Damages Discovery  

1.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Stip to Delay 
Expert Disclosure

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Stip to Delay 
Expert Disclosure

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Stip re_expert 
(002)PDS Edit.docx

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Stip to Delay 
Expert Disclosure

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Stip to Delay 
Expert Disclosure

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Stip to Delay 
Expert Disclosure

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Stip to Delay Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Stip to Delay Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Stip to Delay Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Stip to 

Delay Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/19/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Stip to Delay Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/19/2017 Paul Stevens Review and revise Stipulated Facts for Cross 

Motions Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo -- draft 

of msj
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Stip to Delay Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Stip to Delay Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/20/2017 Paul Stevens Review ORDER re Stipulation deadline for Wells 

Fargo to produce class-wide payroll and 
timekeeping records Review ORDER re Stipulation 
deadline for Wells Fargo to produce class-wide 
payroll and timekeeping records 

0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Stip to Delay 

Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo --draft 

brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/23/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Stip to Delay Expert Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/23/2017 Paul Stevens Review Stipulated Facts for Cross Motions 

Summary Judgement  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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10/24/2017 Paul Stevens Draft facts re: the Classwide HMC Position That 
Plaintiff Held  

2
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo --

draft brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo --

draft brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/25/2017 Paul Stevens Conference call Josh and Jackie Ibarra 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Final 

Stipulated Ibarra Facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/25/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 

Bank N. A. Class Action - another potential suit
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/25/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Final 

Stipulated Ibarra Facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/25/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ3 PDS Edit 3 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Miscellaneous 
Document

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 

Stipulated Facts Final.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Final 

Stipulated Ibarra Facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: wells fargo 

order re dismissed claim
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: You OK with 

these being the exhibits? (we'll turn the Word ones 
into PDFs)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo order 

re dismissed claim
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman You 

OK with these being the exhibits? (we'll turn the 
Word ones into PDFs)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Final Stipulated Ibarra Facts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: You OK with these being the exhibits?
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ7 Version 2 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Stipulated Facts 10-26-17 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/26/2017 Paul Stevens Plaintiff’s Background And Class Members Job 

Duties.  
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/27/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: [Wang v Wells 

Fargo] - L/D to file consent or declination to 
magistrate judge 

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/30/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Josh 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/31/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Plaintiff 

MSJ9.doc
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/31/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/31/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
10/31/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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10/31/2017 Paul Stevens Revise MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ8 Plaintiff MSJ9 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

draft of MSJ and separate statement
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Josh re: Wells Opp to MSJ 1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Wells Fargo 

Revisions
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo -- 

MSJ Haffner decl. Exh.2 (Faktor depo)
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo -- 

MSJ Haffner decl. Exh.2 (Faktor depo)
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

MSJ Haffner decl. Exh.2 (Faktor depo)
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo notice 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Exhibit 5 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ10 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ11 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review Vaquero Papers   review   MPA Proposed 

Order D
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/2/2017 Paul Stevens Vaquero Papers  review  exhibits and pay plan 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: liability issues 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: liability issues 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Vaquero 

Separate Statement.pdf
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Verification 

Wells Fargo's Response to RFPs
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

Notice of MSJ
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo Brief 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo notice 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Verification Wells Fargo's Response to RFPs
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Verification Wells Fargo's Response to RFPs
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Verification Wells Fargo's Response to RFPs
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ notice 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ13 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Sep Statement MSJ (2) 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Review  Vaquero Separate Statement 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Review Order in Vaquero 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/3/2017 Paul Stevens Work on MSJ Statement of Uncontroverted Facts 

and Conclusions of Law  
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

latest drafts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/6/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Josh re: Wells Opp to MSJ 0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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11/6/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft  Sep Statement MSJ (5) 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/6/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ notice (004) 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/6/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Sep Statement MSJ 6 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Not appealable 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Plaintiff 

MSJ16.doc
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

MSJ standard
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo briefs 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ16 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens Vaquero Papers  review  P MSJ Renewed 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens Vaquero Papers  review  Pltfs MSJ (final) 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/7/2017 Paul Stevens Vaquero Papers  review  P's MSJ 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Papers 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

filing for tomorrow
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

filing for tomorrow
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

FINAL Motion Papers
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo filing 

for tomorrow
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ Notice FINAL (PDS rev) 2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/8/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Wells Fargo Proposed Order FINAL 

(PDS rev)
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 

filing for tomorrow
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 

Opp
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 

filing for tomorrow
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

filing for tomorrow
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wellsfargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

filing for tomorrow
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 
filing for tomorrow

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 
filing for tomorrow

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Re: Wells Fargo 
Final filing for today

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 

Filing for today 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo Final 

filing for today
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Pltfs MSJ (FINAL FOR FILING) PDS 

Rev
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Pltfs Statement Uncontorverted Fact 

FINAL
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens Review   Wells Proposed Order 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/9/2017 Paul Stevens Review  Vaquero Pay Plan Docs 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/10/2017 Paul Stevens Review Wells Fargo Request for Judicial Notice   3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/10/2017 Paul Stevens Review WELLS FARGO'S MSJ 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/10/2017 Paul Stevens Review WELLS FARGO'S STATEMENT OF 

UNCONTROVERTED FACTS  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/13/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Josh 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/13/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Tom Kaufman and Josh 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 

case -  call from class ac 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/13/2017 Paul Stevens review  Huy Nguyen v. Wells Fargo Bank_ N.A._ 

2016 U.S. Dist. L
2.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/14/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Pltfs Opp MSJ  PDS Rev 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

opp - draft
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

opp - draft
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/14/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo opp - 

draft
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/15/2017 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: MSJs 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/15/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Deduction and 

subtraction are synonymous
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/15/2017 Paul Stevens review  Judical Notice 2 0.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/15/2017 Paul Stevens Wells Fargos MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo MSJ v2 5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Excerpts 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/16/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

latest brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/17/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/17/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo 

MSJ v5
4.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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11/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo --- draft
opp

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

11/21/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft arguments re: the 
“Shortage” From Any “Draw” or “Advance” Carries 
Forward And Adds Up And Is Always Fully 
Recovered from Future Commissions  

5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/22/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft argument that the 

Court Can Decide The Motion Based on the 
Stipulated Facts  

1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/22/2017 Paul Stevens Wells Fargos MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo MSJ v5 1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/23/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Opp to Wells 

Fargo MSJ v6 11-22-17.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/24/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Opp to Wells 

Fargo MSJ v6 11-22-17.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/27/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo 

MSJ v7
4

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/28/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v Wells 

Fargo 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/28/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Review  D's Stoneledge's 

Statement of Uncontroverted
4.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/29/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo brief 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/29/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Proposed order deny 2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo - 

case re: advance fixes minimum comp.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 

Papers 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - case 

re: advance fixes minimum comp.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo Papers 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Opp Stipulated Facts 

of the Parties
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo 

MSJ v8
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo 

MSJ v9
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Statement of Genuine 

Disputes In Support of Plaintiff's Opposition to MSJ 
V2 

1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Review  Vaquero Pay Plan 

Docs
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
11/30/2017 Paul Stevens Wells Fargos MSJ Review  WF Judical Notice 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v. 
Wells Fargo - Status Report

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Exhibits to 
Josh Haffner Declaration

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Exhibits to 
Josh Haffner Declaration

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Request For 
Judicial Notice in Opposition to Wells Fargo's 
MSJ.doc

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Statement of 

Genuine Disputes In Support of Plaintiff's 
Opposition to MSJ V3.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Statement of 

Genuine Disputes In Support of Plaintiff's 
Opposition to MSJ V3.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo brief 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Exhibits to 

Josh Haffner Declaration
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Exhibits to 

Josh Haffner Declaration
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Exhibits to 

Josh Haffner Declaration
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Haffner Decl In Support of MSJ PDS 

Rev)
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo 

MSJ v11
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo 

MSJ v12
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/1/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Draft Statement of Genuine 

Disputes FINAL
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/2/2017 Paul Stevens Review Wells Fargo’s argument re: 

Prachasaisoradej v. Ralphs Grocery Co. Inc.42 Cal. 
4th 217 (2007)

2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Josh re: Wells Opp to MSJ 0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Objection/Opposition 
(Motion related)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Objection/Opposition 
(Motion related)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Objection/Opposition 
(Motion related)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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12/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Activity in 
Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Objection/Opposition 
(Motion related)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Objection/Opposition 
(Motion related)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Objection/Opposition 
(Motion related)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Objection/Opposition 
(Motion related)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Opp to Wells Fargo FINAL Draft 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Reply to WF Opp to P MSJ 1 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft WF Opp to MSJ Decl WF Docs 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/4/2017 Paul Stevens Opposition to WF MSJ Review  Haffner Decl In 

Support of Opposition to Wells Fagro's MSJ
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/5/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Objection/Opposition 
(Motion related)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/5/2017 Paul Stevens Revise response to Wells Fargo’s Argument re: 

There is No Functional Difference Between An 
“Advance” and a “Draw.”   

1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/6/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Reply to Wells Fargo Opp to P MSA draft 1 6

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Reply to Wells 

Fargo Opp to P MSA draft 2.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Reply to Wells 

Fargo Opp to P MSA draft 2.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/6/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/7/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Reply to Wells 

Fargo Opp to P MSA draft 4.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/7/2017 Paul Stevens Reply re: Plaintiffs MSJ 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/7/2017 Paul Stevens Work on Status Report re Class Notice  2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Declaration of Kelsey Skey re: CPT’S 

notification procedure   
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

Filing
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Status Report
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Status Report
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel 

TKaufman@sheppardmullin.com; 
PBerkowitz@sheppardmullin.com; Josh Haffner 
Fwd: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Status Report

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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12/8/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Thomas Kaufman 
RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Status Report

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Thomas Kaufman 

RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Status Report
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens email notice admin Kelsey Skey; Thomas Kaufman 

RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - Status Report
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens Finalize and file Status report re class notice  

Finalize and file Status report re class notice  
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/8/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ Draft Plaintiff MSJ notice FINAL 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/9/2017 Paul Stevens Draft argument that Vaquero Is Directly On-Point  4.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/10/2017 Paul Stevens Draft response to WF argument re: California Law 

Has Recognized a Sharp Distinction Between an 
Item Serving as a Debit in an Incentive Pay Formula 
and Taking a Deduction From an Earned Wage   

3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/10/2017 Paul Stevens Draft section re: Nguyen v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. 

2016 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 131710 (N.D. Cal. Sep. 20 
2016)  

2.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/10/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: WF CLASS 

ACTION
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/10/2017 Paul Stevens Re-review Vaquero v. Stoneledge Furniture LLC 9 

Cal.App.5th 98 (2017) pay plan   
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/11/2017 Paul Stevens Draft arguments re: Wells Fargo’s Compensation 

Plans Reaffirm That All Hourly Advances Are 
Always Deducted From Commissions.  

3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/11/2017 Paul Stevens Draft response to Wells Fargo’s Argument re: That 

It’s Hourly Pay Is A “Bona Fide” Wage And Not 
Subject To “Recapture”   

2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/12/2017 Paul Stevens  Draft response to WF argument re: Plaintiff 

Presents No Evidence That Wells Fargo Fails to 
Provide HMCs With Bona Fide Paid Rest Periods  

2.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/12/2017 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Torrey Partners, Josh 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/12/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Reply to Wells 

Fargo Opp to P MSA draft 9.docx
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/12/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ revise Reply to Wells Fargo Opp to P MSA 

draft 8
3.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/13/2017 Paul Stevens Drafdt response Wells Fargo’s Argument re: to 

Distinguish Vaquero Have No Merit.   
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/13/2017 Paul Stevens Draft argument that Plaintiff’s Facts In Support of 

the Motion Are Uncontroverted    
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/13/2017 Paul Stevens Draft arguments re:  Wells Fargo’s Compensation 

System is Indistinguishable from Vaquero
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/13/2017 Paul Stevens Draft response to WF argument re: Mere Failure to 

Pay for Otherwise Proper Rest Periods Does Not 
Support Liability Under Section 226.7   

2.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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12/13/2017 Paul Stevens draft Response\argument it Is Not A Profit Sharing 
Plan.   

2
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/13/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Experts 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/13/2017 Paul Stevens Expert confer with Patrick Kennedy Torrey Partners 

re: experpt work on damages for case
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/13/2017 Paul Stevens Revise and draft Re:  WF argument re: Wells 

Fargo’s Pay System Does Not Pay a “Draw” But 
Pays a Bona Fide Hourly Wage for Hours Worked  

0.75

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens Draft argument re: Deducting Or Debiting Rest 

Break Pay From The Commission Is Not Authorized 
by California Law  

4

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens Draft response to Argument pay plan does Not 

Include Any Sort of “Deduction” From Earned 
Wages  

2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/14/2017 Paul Stevens revisions to reply re: cross mtn MSJ separate 

statement various  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/15/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ revise Reply MSJ 13 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/15/2017 Paul Stevens MSJ revise Wells Fargo Reply MSJ FINAL FINAL 2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/16/2017 Paul Stevens Draft Response to Plaintiff Has No Public Policy 

Rationale to Support Her Position  
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/16/2017 Paul Stevens Revisions to Reply re: cross mtn MSJ, separate 

statement, various  
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/17/2017 Paul Stevens Revisions to Reply re: cross mtn MSJ, separate 

statement, various  
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/18/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/18/2017 Paul Stevens Revisions to Reply re: cross mtn MSJ, separate 

statement, various  
5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Reply 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Reply 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Reply 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Reply 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/19/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Reply 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v. 
Wells Fargo -- Production of Distributed Retail 
Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo -- Production of Distributed Retail 
Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo -- Production of Distributed Retail 
Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo -- Production of Distributed Retail 
Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo -- Production of Distributed Retail 
Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo -- Production of Distributed 
Retail Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo -- Production of Distributed 
Retail Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo -- Production of Distributed 
Retail Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/20/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo -- Production of 
Distributed Retail Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/21/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo -- Production of Distributed 
Retail Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo -- Production of Distributed 
Retail Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/21/2017 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo -- Production of Distributed 
Retail Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/23/2017 Paul Stevens call with Jaqueline Ibarra re: claims against Wells 

Fargo  
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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12/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo -- Production of Distributed Retail 
Commission Reports

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/26/2017 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/26/2017 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Susanne Torre; 

pkennedy@torreypartners.com RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo Bank N.A.

0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
12/26/2017 Paul Stevens Expert  Review  Torrey Partner Retainer 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/2/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Jacqueline F 
Ibarra V WFC

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/2/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Jacqueline F 
Ibarra V WFC

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/2/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Jacqueline F 
Ibarra V WFC

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/2/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.

0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/2/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.

0.75
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/2/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy; Joshua 
Haffner; Susanne Torre RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo 
Bank N.A.

0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/2/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Susanne Torre; Patrick 

Kennedy RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/2/2018 Paul Stevens Forward case materials to Torrey Partners 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Torrey Partners, Josh 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Jacqueline F 

Ibarra V WFC
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Jacqueline F 

Ibarra V WFC
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.

0.25
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy; Joshua 
Haffner; Susanne Torre RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo 
Bank N.A.

0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/3/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy; Joshua 

Haffner; Susanne Torre RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo 
Bank N.A.

0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Torrey Partners, Josh 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank NA Billing Instructions
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; 

Veronica Anderson RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank 
NA Billing Instructions

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/4/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  Confer Patrick Kennedy re: Damages 

analysis  
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/5/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Status Report
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/5/2018 Paul Stevens Review and analysis of time and payroll  3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/6/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/8/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  Review and analysis of time and payroll  2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/9/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  Review and analysis of time and payroll  2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo Bank N.A.

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo Bank N.A.

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Invoice # 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank NA Billing Instructions

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/16/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra 

v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/16/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra 

v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/16/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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1/16/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 
Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.

0.25
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/16/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy; Joshua 
Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.

0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/17/2018 Paul Stevens  conference call damages expert Patrick Kennedy 0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/17/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Invoice # 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank NA Billing Instructions
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/17/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/17/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/17/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman FW: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Text Only 
Scheduling Notice

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Text Only 
Scheduling Notice

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Text Only 
Scheduling Notice

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Text Only 
Scheduling Notice

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Patricia Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Patricia Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens Expert Confer Patrick Kennedy Damages analysis 3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/19/2018 Paul Stevens Review ORDER for Summary Judgment; Partial 

Summary Judgment  0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens call with Jaqueline Ibarra re: Order on MSJs  1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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1/20/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Activity in Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia 
Barreras  v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens Pleadings  Review   Stip Dates 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens Pleadings  Review  Declaration 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens Pleadings  Review  Order Schedule 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens Pleadings  Review  Proposed Order 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/20/2018 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/21/2018 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/22/2018 Paul Stevens call with Tom Kaufamn re: stipulation to continue 

mediation completion date selection of mediator  
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Expert Re: damages  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Expert Re: damages determing regular rate 1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens Confenrece call Josh re: Order on MSJ 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens Discuss email from Tom Kaufman re: moving dates 

with Josh Haffner  
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner well fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- pls 

calendar
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens Expert Review and Analysis of commission and 

bonus information
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/23/2018 Paul Stevens Review Court's Order RE: Summary Judgement  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Tom Kaufman abour order on MSJ 

potential mediation  
0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Joint Statement  4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Parra vs. 

Wells Fargo Bank
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra/Barreras
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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1/24/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 
Ibarra/Barreras

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/24/2018 Paul Stevens Expert - Review and Analysis of commission and 
bonus information   

2
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/24/2018 Paul Stevens Meeting with Josh following Order on MSJ 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/24/2018 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens call with member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Tom Kaufman re: stipulating to extend 

expert dislcosure date and mediation  
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Josh re: status and mediation 0.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Deadlines in Ibarra - Time Sensitive
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens Expert - Review and Analysis of commission and 

bonus information
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/25/2018 Paul Stevens Work on Joint Stip. To Cont'd Pre-Trial Deadlines  3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens call with member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Draft Joint Stement after D revisions 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Proposed Stip for Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Rotman
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Rotman
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/26/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Rotman 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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1/26/2018 Paul Stevens Expert Review and Analysis of commission and 
bonus information   

1.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/26/2018 Paul Stevens Finalize Joint Stipulation for Modified Schedule 
Involving Damages Discovery and Mediation  

1.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/26/2018 Paul Stevens Review ORDER ON JOINT STIPULATION TO 
CONTINUE PRETRIAL DEADLINES   

0.25
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/27/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 
Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/27/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra v. 
Wells Fargo - selecting mediator

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/27/2018 Paul Stevens email Email Tom Kaufman re: mediation 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/27/2018 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/28/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo - selecting mediator
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/28/2018 Paul Stevens Respond to Email from class member 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Torrey Partners, Josh 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo - Mediation March 21 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

regular rate of compensation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray [Wells Fargo] - 

L/D to designate experts & Provide reports required 
by Fed R Civ 26(a)(2)(B)

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra v. 

Wells Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

damages
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/30/2018 Paul Stevens Expert Patrick Kennedy Analysis. Review report  0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/31/2018 Paul Stevens Expert Patrick Kennedy Analysis. Review report  0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/31/2018 Paul Stevens Expert Patrick Kennedy Analysis. Review report  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
1/31/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/1/2018 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Josh re: status and mediation 1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/1/2018 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Tom kaufman and Josh 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Automatic reply: 

L.R. 16-2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman L.R. 16-

2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
L.R. 16-2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

L.R. 16-2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

L.R. 16-2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

L.R. 16-2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

L.R. 16-2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

L.R. 16-2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Rotman
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Rotman
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Rotman
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Rotman
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Rotman
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  review damages report 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/1/2018 Paul Stevens Local Rules and Samples Review  

2017_December_LRs_Chap_1
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/2/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: attorney fees 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

L.R. 16-2 Meeting of Counsel Before Final Pretrial 
Conference

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/2/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  review damages report 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/2/2018 Paul Stevens Review Local Rules and Sample PTCO 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/3/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  review damages report 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/4/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

wage and hour mutiplier
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/4/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  review damages report 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/5/2018 Paul Stevens  Review  Kennedy Expert Report 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/5/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/5/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/5/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra Wells 

Fargo Proposed Final Pretrial Conference Order 
Draft 1.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/5/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra Wells 

Fargo Proposed Final Pretrial Conference Order 
Draft 1.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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2/5/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 
letters to Washington class meers

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/5/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo letters 
to Washington class meers

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/5/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Ibarra 
Wells Fargo Proposed Final Pretrial Conference 
Order Draft 1.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/5/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  review damages report 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/6/2018 Paul Stevens Conference Call with Torrey Partners, Josh 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/6/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/6/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - 

expert designation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: damages stip 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - 

proposed stip
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - 

proposed stip
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman FW: 

Ibarra - Def_s Rule 26(a)(2) Disclosure of Expert 
Testimony.PDF

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra - Def_s Rule 26(a)(2) Disclosure of Expert 
Testimony.PDF

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra - Def_s Rule 26(a)(2) Disclosure of Expert 
Testimony.PDF

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra Plaintiff's Rule 26(a)(2) Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Paul 

Berkowitz; Jason Brown Ibarra Plaintiff's Rule 
26(a)(2) Disclosure

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  Review  Ibarra Plainitiff's Rule 26(a)(2) 

Disclosure
4

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/7/2018 Paul Stevens Review Wells Fargo's Damages Report 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/8/2018 Paul Stevens Conf call Tom Kaufman re: stipulating to Damages 

and trial plan
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/8/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra Plaintiff's Rule 26(a)(2) Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/8/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra Plaintiff's Rule 26(a)(2) Disclosure
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/8/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/8/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: STIPULATION OF FACTS AND 
PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER RE 
REMAINING ISSUES FOR TRIAL.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/8/2018 Paul Stevens Review Wells Fargo's Damages Report 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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2/9/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Tom Kaufman and Josh re: expert exhange 1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Experts 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Experts 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Experts 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Experts 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Accepted: Josh and Paul to Call Tom K
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Experts 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Experts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Experts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Experts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (003).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Experts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Experts
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/9/2018 Paul Stevens Review the parties damages Reports 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

2/11/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: 
STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (003).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/11/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (003).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/11/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (003).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/11/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (003).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens  Work on Joint Stip to Clarify Remaining Issue for 

Trial 
5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: revising stipulation re: trial 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: 
STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/12/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: STIPULATION OF FACTS AND 
PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER RE 
REMAINING ISSUES FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray (via Dropbox) 

Maisha McCray shared "Docs Produced" with you
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Revised Stip in Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Revised Stip Re Damages
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Revised Stip Re Damages
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Revised Stip Re Damages
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
STIPULATION OF FACTS AND PROPOSED 
SCHEDULING ORDER RE REMAINING ISSUES 
FOR TRIAL (004).docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Revised Stip in Ibarra
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman 

Revised Stip Re Damages
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Joshua 

Haffner RE: Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens Re: case management plan for remaining issues at 

trial   
1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/13/2018 Paul Stevens Re: case management plan for remaining issues at 

trial   
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/14/2018 Paul Stevens Re: case management plan for remaining issues at 

trial   
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/15/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: damages issues 0.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/15/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/15/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Order

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/20/2018 Paul Stevens call with Jaqueline Ibarra re: trail on damages 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/20/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A. et al.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/21/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/21/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/21/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/21/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/21/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Accompanying Proposed Order
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/23/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Chat re 

Ibarra briefly?
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/23/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Chat re Ibarra briefly?
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/23/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Chat re Ibarra briefly?
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/23/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Chat re Ibarra briefly?
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/23/2018 Paul Stevens email to Plaintiffs Expert Patrick Kennedy RE: 

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank N.A.
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/25/2018 Paul Stevens Review Section II. 3 of the Civil Trial Scheduling 

Order   
0.75

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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2/25/2018 Paul Stevens review standing order  0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/26/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Motion to 

Consolidate
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/27/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A. et al.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/27/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Ibarra v. Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A. et al.
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/27/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/28/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Wells Fargo 

class action lawsuit
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/28/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: I also had this 

inquiry this morning
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
2/28/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: 

JACQUELINE F. IBARRA et.at.v. WELLS FARGO
BANK NA

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/1/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Trial Brief on Damages 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/2/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Trial Brief on Damages 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/3/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Trial Brief on Damages 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/4/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Trial Brief on Damages 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/5/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Mediation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/5/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Mediation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/5/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Mediation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/6/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Mediation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/6/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Mediation
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/7/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: mediation brief 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/7/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo brief 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/7/2018 Paul Stevens Review Wert v US Bancorp 0.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/8/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: mediation brief 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/9/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/12/2018 Paul Stevens Draft additional facts for Trial Brief 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/12/2018 Paul Stevens Med Work on Mediation Brief 8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Findings of Fact and Conclusions of law 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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3/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/13/2018 Paul Stevens Revise Mediation Brief 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens  Draft Trial Brief  3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Findings of Fact and Conclusions of law 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens Edit Mediation Brief 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo RJN 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/14/2018 Paul Stevens Review  Employees With Missing Data 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/15/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Prposed Order Damages 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/15/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/15/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/15/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/15/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Facts and Law 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Memorandum of 
Contentions of Fact and Law

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Activity in 

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS Patricia Barreras  v. 
Wells Fargo Bank N.A. et al Memorandum of 
Contentions of Fact and Law

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo -- 

main brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Haffner Law 

Distribution Agreement - March 16th 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo --
main brief

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo --
main brief

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens Finalize TRIAL BRIEF re: Damages filed by 

Plaintiff Jacqueline F. Ibarra Request for Judicial 
Notice   

3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens Review WELLS FARGO BANK N.AS PROPOSED

FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF 
LAW FOR DAMAGES TRIAL  

0.75

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens Review WELLS FARGO trial brief REGARDING 

DAMAGES  
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/16/2018 Paul Stevens Review WELLS FARGO's proposed findings  1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/17/2018 Paul Stevens review TRIAL BRIEF of DEFENDANT WELLS 

FARGO BANK N.A.S REGARDING PROPER 
CALCULATION OF CLASSWIDE DAMAGES  

1.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/17/2018 Paul Stevens Work on argument re: The “Hour of Pay” Damages 

Awarded for Failure to Provide Proper Rest Periods 
Are Measured at One Hour of Each Class Member’s 
Base Hourly Pay Rate  

3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/18/2018 Paul Stevens Plaintiffs Response To Defendant Wells Fargo Bank 

N.As Proposed Findings Of Fact And Conclusions 
Of Law For Damages Trial filed by Plaintiff 
Jacqueline F. Ibarra  

2.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/18/2018 Paul Stevens Review WELLS FARGO BANK N.AS RESPONSE 

TO PLAINTIFFS PROPOSED FINDINGS  
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/19/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

Class Case
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/19/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 

Class Case
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/19/2018 Paul Stevens Expert  Review  Earn Types - For Review 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/19/2018 Paul Stevens Mediation Draft Ibarra v Wells Fargo Mediation 

Brief FINAL
3

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: Mediation 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra - 

Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law 
for Damages Trial.DOCX

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra - 

Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law 
for Damages Trial.DOCX

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman FW: 

Ibarra - Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions 
of Law for Damages Trial.DOCX

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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3/20/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Ibarra - 
Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law 
for Damages Trial.DOCX

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra - Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions 
of Law for Damages Trial.DOCX

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2018 Paul Stevens Respond to Wells Fargo argument re: The Class 

Damages Award Should Be Reduced to Account for 
Class Members Who Earned Only Hourly Pay  

4.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/20/2018 Paul Stevens Travel to mediation  2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/21/2018 Paul Stevens Appearance Mediation 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/21/2018 Paul Stevens Meet with Josh following mediaton 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/21/2018 Paul Stevens Respond to Wells Fargo argument re: There Is No 

Basis to Award Prejudgment Interest Here  
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/21/2018 Paul Stevens Travel travel home from mediation 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/22/2018 Paul Stevens Response to Trial Brief 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Proposed 

Findings Fact and Law
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Proposed 

Findings Fact and Law
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Ibarra vs Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A. Case Nuer 17-04344-PA
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra vs 

Wells Fargo Bank N.A. Case Nuer 17-04344-PA
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Proposed 

Findings Fact and Law
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Proposed 

Findings Fact and Law
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/23/2018 Paul Stevens Response to Trial Brief 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/27/2018 Paul Stevens Work on argument re: Class Members Are Paid 

Based On Their Commission.  The Hourly Advance 
Is Not The “Regular Rate Of Compensation” 
Because It Is “Not Compensation At All.”  

4.5

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/28/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Proposed Order and Proposed Findings 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/29/2018 Paul Stevens Call with Josh re: response brief 0.3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/29/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Proposed Order and Proposed Findings 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner FW: Wells Fargo 

(Ibarra) - call from class member 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo - 

response draft
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/29/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra vs Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A. Case Nuer 17-04344-PA
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra vs Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A. Case Nuer 17-04344-PA
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Brief 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner RE: Wells Fargo 0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 
Brief

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Wells Fargo 
Brief

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Brief 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner wells fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Wells Fargo Brief 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Ibarra vs Wells 

Fargo Bank N.A. Case Nuer 17-04344-PA
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Ibarra vs 

Wells Fargo Bank N.A. Case Nuer 17-04344-PA
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

Brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

Brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

Brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

Brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

Brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray RE: Wells Fargo 

Brief
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Maisha McCray Wells Fargo 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens Plaintiffs Response To Defendants Proposed 

Findings Of Fact And Conclusions Of Law   
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/30/2018 Paul Stevens Plaintiffs' response Trial Brief re: Classwide 

Damages Proposed Order After Trial)
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/31/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/31/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
3/31/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel 

TKaufman@sheppardmullin.com 
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra v. 

WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank N.A._s 
Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman Re: 

Ibarra Mediator's Proposal
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra Mediator's Proposal
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank 
N.A._s Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 
Ibarra v. WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank 
N.A._s Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank 
N.A._s Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank 
N.A._s Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank 
N.A._s Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Ibarra v. WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank 
N.A._s Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman RE: 

Wells Fargo Draft Class Notice Redline with opt our 
form.docx

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Jason 

Brown; Joshua Haffner; Praveeta Garcia RE: Ibarra 
v. WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank N.A._s 
Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/2/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Tom Kaufman RE: Ibarra 

Mediator's Proposal
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/2/2018 Paul Stevens
Search of Studies on results in class litigation and 
indivudal class results 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/2/2018 Paul Stevens Work on motion for atty fee 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Conf Call meet and confer Tom Kaufman Re: 

authenticity of trial exhibits 
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Conf Call meet and confer Tom Kaufman Re: 

authenticity of trial exhibits 
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Conf Call Meet and confer Tom Kaufman re: 

Defendants intended Power Point
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Conference call Josh Haffner re: LR 7-3 Motion for 

Attorneys Fees
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Conference call Tom Kaufman re: LR 7-3 Motion 

for Attorneys Fees
1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Fwd: Ibarra v. 

WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo Bank N.A._s 
Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Review MINUTE ORDER re: attorneys' fees 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Review ORDER re: the court trial calendared for 

April 10, 2018
0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/3/2018 Paul Stevens
Search of Studies on results in class litigation and 
indivudal class results 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Work on motion for atty fee 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Work on slide presention and dislcosure 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/3/2018 Paul Stevens Work on slide presention and dislcosure 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/4/2018 Paul Stevens   Work on slide presention and dislcosure 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/4/2018 Paul Stevens Conf Call Meet and confer Tom Kaufman re: 

Defendants intended Power Point 
2

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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4/4/2018 Paul Stevens email co-counsel Joshua Haffner Re: Ibarra v. WFB -
Defendant Wells Fargo Bank N.A._s Disclosure of 
Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/4/2018 Paul Stevens email defendant's counsel Thomas Kaufman; Jason 

Brown RE: Ibarra v. WFB - Defendant Wells Fargo 
Bank N.A._s Disclosure of Demonstrative Exhibit

0.1

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/5/2018 Paul Stevens Review ORDER re: the court trial calendared for 

April 10 2018  
0.25

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/5/2018 Paul Stevens Work on slide presention and dislcosure   7 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/6/2018 Paul Stevens Conference call with Josh re: motion for fees 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/6/2018 Paul Stevens Review MINUTE ORDER re: attorneys' fees  0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/9/2018 Paul Stevens Re_review Vicaino and Bluetooth, and recent cases 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/10/2018 Paul Stevens further research on multipliers in class settlements 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/10/2018 Paul Stevens
Work on Brief for Motion for Fees, Costs and Class 
Rep Award 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/14/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/15/2018 Paul Stevens
Further research and review on studies re: results in 
wage and hour lititgation 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

17-Apr Paul Stevens

Further research and review on studies re: results 
and number of judgements in wage and hour 
lititgation 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/17/2018 Paul Stevens Work on motion for atty fee 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/20/2018 Paul Stevens

Review case results and fee motions in recent cases - 
Pier I imports, Wells Fargo Wage and Hour Cases, 
In Re Volkswagen 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Paul Stevens
 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn RE: Ibarra 
Attorney's Fees 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Paul Stevens Conf Call Haffner Law re: Costs and time billings 
and Joint Statements

0.5
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Paul Stevens Conference call Josh Haffner re: LR 7-3 Motion for 
Attorneys Fees  

0.25
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Paul Stevens Conference call Tom Kaufman re: LR 7-3 Motion 
for Attorneys Fees  

0.25
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Paul Stevens Email Tom Kaufman re: LR 7-3 Motion for 
Attorneys Fees  

0.1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and Confer with Defendant on Draft Joint 
Statements of Fee's and Costs 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/23/2018 Paul Stevens Re: Ibarra Attorney's Fees 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/23/2018 Paul Stevens work on Attorney's Fees Motion 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2018 Paul Stevens Work on Fee Motion 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/24/2018 Paul Stevens Work on Joint Statements for Costs and time 

billings 
4

Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
4/25/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Joint Statements of Fee's and Costs 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/25/2018 Paul Stevens
Ibarra v Wells Fargo JOINT STATEMENT Billing 
Records.xlsx 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/25/2018 Paul Stevens
Ibarra v Wells Fargo JOINT STATEMENT Billing 
Records.xlsx 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/25/2018 Paul Stevens Research applicability re: liability for premium on 
bond for appeal

1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Case 2:17-cv-04344-PA-AS   Document 62-4   Filed 06/18/18   Page 82 of 115   Page ID
 #:1429



4/26/2018 Paul Stevens Conf Call Josh re: Costs and time billings and Joint 
Statements

1
Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/26/2018 Paul Stevens RE: Ibarra v Wells Fargo Joint Statement Re Billing 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/27/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/27/2018 Paul Stevens Work re: Attorney Fee Motion 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/29/2018 Paul Stevens
 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Joint Statement 
Class Counsel's Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

4/30/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and Confer with Defendant on Draft Joint 
Statements of Fee's and Costs 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/1/2018 Paul Stevens
 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Joint Statement 
Class Counsel's Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/1/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/2/2018 Paul Stevens
Further research and review on studies re: results in 
wage and hour lititgation 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/3/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/3/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and Confer with Defendant on Draft Joint 
Statements of Fee's and Costs 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/3/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and Confer with Defendant on Draft Joint 
Statements of Fee's and Costs 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/4/2018 Paul Stevens
 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Joint Statement 
Class Counsel's Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/4/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/7/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/7/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufman Joint Statement 
Class Counsel's Time and Costs

0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/7/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/8/2018 Paul Stevens Work on motion for atty fee 6 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/9/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and confer Re: Confidential Communication - 
Joint Statement Class Counsel's Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/9/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and Confer Tom Kaufman Re: Meet and 
Confer Tom Kaufman Re: Ibarra/Barreras Appeal 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/9/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/9/2018 Paul Stevens Work on motion for atty fee 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/10/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/10/2018 Paul Stevens Meet and confer RE: Bond motion 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/10/2018 Paul Stevens Meet and confer re: Bond motion 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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5/10/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and Confer Tom Kaufman Re: Ibarra/Barreras 
Appeal 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/10/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/10/2018 Paul Stevens
Work on motion for atty fee - review developments 
in law, decision in other matters 5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2018 Paul Stevens

 Meet and confer Tom Kaufamn Re: Confidential 
Communication - Joint Statement Class Counsel's 
Time and Costs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2018 Paul Stevens Meet and confer Re: Bond motion 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2018 Paul Stevens

Meet and confer RE: Ibarra Wells Fargo JOINT 
Meet an dconfer STATEMENT Class Counsel 
Costs V2.xlsx 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and Confer Tom Kaufman Re: RE: Bond 
motion 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2018 Paul Stevens
RE: Ibarra Wells Fargo JOINT STATEMENT Class 
Counsel Costs V2.xlsx 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/11/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/11/2018 Paul Stevens Work on motion for atty fee 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/12/2018 Paul Stevens
Meet and confer Re: Ibarra Wells Fargo JOINT 
STATEMENT Class Counsel Time 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/12/2018 Paul Stevens Work on motion for atty fee 8 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/13/2018 Paul Stevens
Further research and review on studies re: results in 
wage and hour lititgation 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/13/2018 Paul Stevens

Meet and confer Ibarra v Wells Fargo JOINT 
STATEMENT CC Time Records -- WF 
Disputes.xlsx 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/14/2018 Paul Stevens Meet and confer Price of Bond for Appeal in Ibarra 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/14/2018 Paul Stevens

Meet and confer Re: Ibarra v Wells Fargo JOINT 
STATEMENT CC Time Records -- WF 
Disputes.xlsx 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/14/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/15/2018 Paul Stevens Meet an dconfer Tom Kaufman RE: Opt outs 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/15/2018 Paul Stevens
Review Ibarra - Motion for Relief for Requirement 
to Post Supersedeas Bond 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/17/2018 Paul Stevens Phone call class member Andy Slaton 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/17/2018 Paul Stevens Work on time and cost records 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/18/2018 Paul Stevens further research on multipliers in class settlements 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/18/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/21/2018 Paul Stevens Prepare Application for Taxable Costs 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
5/21/2018 Paul Stevens Re: position on Bond 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/22/2018 Paul Stevens

Further research and review on studies re: results 
and number of judgements in wage and hour 
lititgation 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/22/2018 Paul Stevens Prepare application for taxable costs 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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5/23/2018 Paul Stevens

Further research and review on studies re: results 
and number of judgements in wage and hour 
lititgation 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/23/2018 Paul Stevens Phone call class member Kristy Taylor 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/29/2018 Paul Stevens
Revise Brief for Motion for Fees, Costs and Class 
Rep Award 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/30/2018 Paul Stevens
Revise Brief for Motion for Fees, Costs and Class 
Rep Award 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

5/31/2018 Paul Stevens
Revise Brief for Motion for Fees, Costs and Class 
Rep Award 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/1/2018 Paul Stevens
Revise Brief for Motion for Fees, Costs and Class 
Rep Award 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/2/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Response to Bond 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/4/2018 Paul Stevens
Conference Call damages expert re: class member 
individual amounts 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/4/2018 Paul Stevens
Work on Declaration for Motion for Fees, Costs and 
Class Rep Award 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/5/2018 Paul Stevens
re-review Laffitte v. Robert Half Internat., Inc., 1 
Cal. 5th 480, 503 (2016).  0.75 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/5/2018 Paul Stevens

review Dynabursky v. Alliedbarton Security 
Services, LP, 2016 WL 8921915, *5 (C.D.Cal. 
2016).  0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/5/2018 Paul Stevens Review In Re National Collegiate Athletic Associatio 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/6/2018 Paul Stevens
Review Glass v. UBS Financial Services, Inc., 2007 
WL 221862, *15 (N.D.Cal. 2007) 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/6/2018 Paul Stevens

Review In Re: Volkswagen “Clean Diesel” 
Marketing, Sales Practices, And Products Liability 
Litigation, MDL No. 2672, Dckt 3053, 3/17/17, 8:1-
8 (N.D. Cal. May 17, 2017) 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/6/2018 Paul Stevens
review Wells Fargo Wage and Hour Cases, 
JCCP004821 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/8/2018 Paul Stevens
Conference call damages expert Mickey Olsen re: 
analysis 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/8/2018 Paul Stevens Draft Declaration of Jacqueline Ibarra 2.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/8/2018 Paul Stevens Text from and to Class member Jeff T 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/9/2018 Paul Stevens

Conference Call damages expert Patrick Kennedy 
and Kevin Taylor re: class member individual 
amounts 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/9/2018 Paul Stevens
Review Individual Class members Distribution 
estimates 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/10/2018 Paul Stevens
Review Individual Class members Distribution 
estimates 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/11/2018 Paul Stevens
Review Individual Class members Distribution 
estimates 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/11/2018 Paul Stevens

Review Ladore v. Ecolab, Inc. (C.D. Cal., Nov. 12, 
2013, No. CV 11-9386 FMO (JCX)) 2013 WL 
12246339, at *11 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/11/2018 Paul Stevens Work on Joint Statement of Costs 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
6/11/2018 Paul Stevens Work on Joint Statement of Costs 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/12/2018 Paul Stevens
Conf Call Jacqueline Ibarra re questions re 
declaration 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/12/2018 Paul Stevens
Review Individual Class members Distribution 
estimates 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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6/12/2018 Paul Stevens further research on multipliers in class settlements 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/13/2018 Paul Stevens
Draft Proposed Order for Fees, Costs and Incentive 
Award 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/13/2018 Paul Stevens Further research re Incentive awards 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/13/2018 Paul Stevens
Review Individual Class members Distribution 
estimates 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/13/2018 Paul Stevens
Revise Brief for Motion for Fees, Costs and Class 
Rep Award 3.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2018 Paul Stevens
Call with JHH re: various issues to finalize motion 
for fee and class rep award 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2018 Paul Stevens
Conf Call Jacqueline Ibarra re questions re 
declaration 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2018 Paul Stevens
Conf Call Jacqueline Ibarra re questions re 
delcaration 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2018 Paul Stevens
email D counsel Tom re: Joint Statements of Costs 
and Time 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2018 Paul Stevens
Email Tom Kaufman re: briefing scehdule for 
appeal 0.1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2018 Paul Stevens
Review Individual Class members Distribution 
estimates 0.25 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/14/2018 Paul Stevens
Work on Declaration for Motion for Fees, Costs and 
Class Rep Award 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/15/2018 Paul Stevens
Final revisions to Motion for Fees and supporting 
papers 4.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

6/18/2018 Paul Stevens
Review and finalize papers re: Motion for Fees and 
supporting papers for filing 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

TOTAL: 1006.95 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/5/2017 Praveeta Garcia work on compiling witness list 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/11/2017 Praveeta Garcia work on draft of objections and responses 3 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/25/2017 Praveeta Garcia t/c with client re docs for production 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
7/26/2017 Praveeta Garcia upload docs rec'd from client 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

7/27/2017 Praveeta Garcia
file via electronically joint notice of selection of 
private mediator 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/2/2017 Praveeta Garcia work on document production, bates labeling, etc. 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/3/2017 Praveeta Garcia
work on printing documents and finalizing for  
production 2 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

8/24/2017 Praveeta Garcia
confirm depo date with Plaintiff and update on 
status 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

10/5/2017 Praveeta Garcia assist plaintiff with review of depo transcript 1 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/4/2017 Praveeta Garcia
work on TOC and TOA for Opp. To MSJ; review 
other docs for filing with OPP. 4 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/5/2017 Praveeta Garcia finalize and file Opp and supporting docs 1.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

12/6/2017 Praveeta Garcia
coordinate with US Legal for delivery of courtesy 
copies 0.5 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.

Necessary and reasonable
TOTAL: 18 Do not oppose. Necessary and reasonable Do not oppose.
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Date Item Description

Amount of Costs 
Sought By Movant 

(U.S. Dollars Respondent's Position 

Stevens, LC

08/27/2017 Delta Air lines

For Travel Airfare from Los 
Angeles to Des Moine for 
Deposition of Wells Fargo Mark 
Faktor (LA to Iowa) 921.60 Do Not Oppose

09/28/2017 Holiday Inn
For Travel Hotel for Deposition 
of Wells Fargo Mark Faktor 177.92 Do Not Oppose

01/16/2018 CPT Group Inc. Class Notice mailing 2,902.90 Do Not Oppose
02/16/2018 Torrey Partners, LLC Damages Expert 26,905.50 Do Not Oppose
03/06/2018 David A. Rotman Mediator 5,875.00 Do Not Oppose

03/13/2018 Southwest Airlines

For Travel airfare from Los 
Angeles to Oakland for 
mediation in San Francisco 376.96 Do Not Oppose

03/13/2018 Sir Francis Drake Hotel
For Travel hotel for mediation in 
San Francisco 645.37 Do Not Oppose

3/19/2018 Torrey Partners, LLC Damages Expert 12,139.00 Do Not Oppose

3/21/2018 SFR Taxi
Taxi to airport from Mediation in 
SF to Oakland 75.00 Do Not Oppose

03/21/2018
Bob Hope Airport 
Parking For Travel to mediation 48.00 Do Not Oppose

3/20/2018 Taxi Pass.com
Taxi from Oakland airport to SF 
for Mediation 104.50 Do Not Oppose

6/13/2018 Torrey Partners, LLC Damages Expert 2,950.00 Do Not Oppose
TOTAL STEVENS 53,121.75 Do Not Oppose
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Haffner Law
8/26/2017 Delta Airline Airfare to depo 1,012.60 Do Not Oppose

9/5/2017 Identical Copy Printing of doc production 360.68 Do Not Oppose
9/12/2017 1901 Ave of Stars Parking for Plaintiff Depo 35.60 Do Not Oppose
9/15/2017 Holiday Inn Hotel for Des Moines Depo 192.76 Do Not Oppose
9/15/2017 LAX Airport Parking for PMK Depo 60.00 Do Not Oppose

10/17/2017 Nationwide Court Services 200.15 Do Not Oppose
3/2/2018 Southwest Airlines Travel for Mediation 537.96 Do Not Oppose
3/2/2018 David A. Rotman Mediation 5,875.00 Do Not Oppose

3/22/2018 Bob Hope Airport Parking 24.00 Do Not Oppose
3/22/2018 SWA InFlight Wifi Depo of Mark Faktor 8.00 Do Not Oppose
3/24/2018 Elite Sedan Service Travel to Mediation 95.00 Do Not Oppose

TOTAL HAFFNER 8,401.75 Do Not Oppose

TOTAL BOTH LAW 
FIRMS 61,523.50 Do Not Oppose
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June 13, 2018

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A., et al.

Paul D. Stevens, Esquire
Stevens LC
The BLOC 700 S. Flower Street, Suite 660
Los Angeles, CA 90017

Re:

Date

Invoice # 15956

pstevens@stevenslc.com

$2,925.00

$2,925.00
0.00

12,139.00

Professional Services
Expenses Incurred

Total Payments/Adjustments

Total Previous Balance

Balance Due

Please call 858-847-0001 with any questions you may have regarding this invoice.

Please remit payments by check to:

Accounts Receivable
Torrey Partners, LLC

11452 El Camino Real, Suite 110
San Diego, CA 92130

Tax ID 45-0651612

Services Rendered Through June 13, 2018

2,925.00Current Charges

Payment is due by 30 days from invoice date

(12,139.00)
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Paul D. Stevens, Esquire

1Page

Ibarra v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A., et al.

Invoice #
Services Rendered Through June 13, 2018

15956

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
Name Hours Rate Amount
Patrick Kennedy 1.50 525.00 $787.50
Kevin Taylor 2.50 325.00 $812.50
Mickey Olson 5.00 265.00 $1,325.00
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SkyMiles®#*******202 >

From: Delta Air Lines
To: Maisha McCray
Subject: Your Flight Receipt - JOSHUA H HAFFNER 13SEP17
Date: Friday, August 25, 2017 4:27:35 PM

Thanks for choosing Delta. Your Flight is confirmed.

Hello, JOSHUA H

 Your Trip Confirmation #: GJ86P6

Wed, 13SEP DEPART ARRIVE

DELTA 1343 LOS ANGELES, CA

11:45am

DETROIT

7:15pm

DELTA 3613* DETROIT

7:55pm

DES MOINES, IA

8:44pm

Thu, 14SEP DEPART ARRIVE

DELTA 4572* DES MOINES, IA

5:44pm

SALT LAKE CITY

7:34pm

DELTA 1211 SALT LAKE CITY

8:15pm

LOS ANGELES, CA

9:15pm

*Flight 3613 Operated by ENDEAVOR AIR DBA DELTA CONNECTION
*Flight 4572 Operated by SKYWEST DBA DELTA CONNECTION

ARRIVE ON TIME

For passengers traveling domestically (within the U.S): 
Due to peak summer travel season, many airports are experiencing a high volume of passengers,
resulting in long check-in, baggage drop and security checkpoint lines.
Please plan to arrive at the airport at least 2 hours prior to your scheduled departure time.

For passengers traveling internationally: 
Due to recently-implemented U.S. Department of Homeland Security (DHS) enhanced security
requirements for customers traveling from any non U.S. location, we strongly advise all customers to
arrive at the airport at least 3 hours prior to your scheduled departure time and to
proceed to your departure gate promptly to allow extra time to clear security. 

We also encourage passengers to check-in online at delta.com or via the Fly Delta app to help avoid
delays.

RESTRICTED HAZARDOUS ITEMS

To ensure the safety of our customers and employees, Delta no longer accepts hoverboards or
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any lithium battery powered self-balancing personal transportation devices on board its
aircraft. These items are prohibited as both carry-on and checked baggage.

Spare batteries for other devices, fuel cells, and e-cigarettes are permitted in carry-on
baggage only. If your carry-on bag contains these items and is gate checked, they must be
removed and carried in the cabin. Further information and specific guidelines regarding
restricted items can be found here.

Passenger Info

NAME
JOSHUA H HAFFNER
SkyMiles #*******202

FLIGHT SEAT
DELTA 1343 Select Seat
DELTA 3613 Select Seat
DELTA 4572
DELTA 1211

Visit delta.com or use the Fly Delta app to view, select or change your seat.
If you purchased a Delta Comfort+™ seat or a Trip Extra, please visit My Trips to access a receipt
of your purchase.

Flight Receipt

Ticket #: 0062394877537

Place of Issue: Delta.com

Ticket Issue Date: 25AUG17

Ticket Expiration Date: 25AUG18

METHOD OF PAYMENT

Org FOP AX***********1008

CHARGES

Air Transportation Charges

Base Fare $899.54 USD

Taxes, Fees and Charges

United States - September 11th Security

Fee(Passenger Civil Aviation Security Service Fee) (AY)

$11.20 USD

United States - Passenger Facility Charge (XF) $18.00 USD

United States - Flight Segment Tax (ZP) $16.40 USD

United States - Transportation Tax (US) $67.46 USD

TICKET AMOUNT $1012.60 USD

NON-REF/NON-END - PENALTY APPLIES

This ticket is non-refundable unless the original ticket was issued at a fully refundable fare. Some fares may not
allow changes. If allowed, any change to your itinerary may require payment of a change fee and increased fare.
Failure to appear for any flight without notice to Delta will result in cancellation of your remaining reservation.
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INVOICE 
P.O. Box 811056 

Los Angeles, CA. 90081 
Date 

8/28/2017 

BILL TO PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO 

Haffner Law 
445 S. Figueroa Street 
Suite 2325 
Los Angles, CA 90071 

Requestor 

Maisha 

Description 

Identical Copy 
P.O. Box 811056 
Los Angeles, CA 900811 

Billing Reference/Client Matter Terms 

Ibarra v. Well Fargo Due on receipt 

Quantity Rate 

B/W Blow Backs on 3 hole and insert into binders: 3,309 

Thank you for choosing Identical Copy 
Subtotal 

0,10 

Payments for any services will be due on the 30th day of invoicing. 1.5% late charge will be 
assess if payment is past due. Please remit promptly to avoid this charge. 

Sales Tax (9.0%) 

Total 

Invoice# 

16131 

FEDERAL TA ... 

#46-0471916 

Amount 

330.90T 

$330,90 

$29.78 

$360,68 
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Business Platinum Card® 

(l]�ij�i-. 
p. 5/15

HAFFNER LAW PC 
JOSHUAH HAFFNER 
Closing Date 09/19/17  

[ Detail Continued 
Amount 

        

    

 I    

   

09/11/17 LOS ANGELES CA $35.60 1901 AVENUE OF THE STARS AMAU366501 AM 

3035738121 
Description Price 
PARKING FEES $35.60 

    

09/12/17    

09/13/17   

09/13/17    

09/13/17    

09/14/17 HOLIDAY INN DOWNTOWN- MERCY AREA DES MOINES IA $192.76 
Arrival Date Departure Date 
09/13/17 09/14/17 
00000000 
LODGING 

09/15/17 WS ANGELES CA $60.00 

   

LAX AIRPORT LOT P 

310-646-2188

     

     

    
 

     

Continued on reverse 
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1609 JAMES M. WOOD BLVD I LOS ANGELES I CA90015 

HAFFNER LAW PC 
445 S FIGUEROA SUITE 2325 
ATTN: ACCTS PAYABLE 
LOS ANGELES, CA 90071 

9/30/17 

FOR ANY BILLING INQUIRIES 
PLEASE CALL ACCOUNTING AT 
(213) 249-9970 
TAX ID# 20-8284527 

5, 9.83 .26 

-----X·------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

STANDARD RESEARCH-NEXTDAY 
600 SOUTH COMMONWEALTH AVENUE 

LOS ANGELES CA 90005 

Caller: MAISHA MCCRAY 

Case Number: BC522676 

Documents: COPIES OF DOCUMENTS -

Client/Matter: WELLS FARGO 

Waiting Time: 120mins 

445 S. FIGUEROA STREET 

LOS ANGELES CA 90071 

Case Title: VAQUERO V STONELEDGE 

Signed by: MAISHA 

Total Charges for Ref. - WELLS FARGO: 200.15 

INVOICE PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT 

wait/Rsrch: 
Adv Fees 
Check Chgs: 

78.00 
63.00 

3.15 

Total • 

200.15 
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From: Southwest Airlines
To: Maisha McCray
Subject: Flight reservation (S36X3R) | 21MAR18 | BUR-OAK | Haffner/Joshua
Date: Friday, March 02, 2018 9:15:13 AM

Thanks for choosing Southwest® for your trip.

Southwest Airlines
 Log in | View my itinerary

Check In Online Check Flight Status Change Flight Special Offers Hotel Offers Car Offers

Ready for takeoff!

Thanks for choosing Southwest® for your trip. You'll find everything you need to know

about your reservation below. Happy travels!

Air itinerary

AIR Confirmation: S36X3R Confirmation Date: 03/2/2018

Passenger(s) Rapid Rewards # Ticket # Expiration
Est. Points
Earned

HAFFNER/JOSHUA 480934716 5261419929099 Mar 2, 2019 5686

Rapid Rewards points earned are only estimates. Visit your (MySouthwest, Southwest.com or Rapid Rewards) account for

the most accurate totals - including A-List & A-List Preferred bonus points.

Date Flight Business Select Departure/Arrival

Wed Mar 21 463 Depart BURBANK, CA (BUR) on Southwest

Airlines at 07:00 AM

Arrive in OAKLAND, CA (OAK) at 08:15 AM

Travel Time 1 hrs 15 mins

Business Select

Date Flight Business Select Departure/Arrival

Wed Mar 21 756 Depart OAKLAND, CA (OAK) on Southwest

Airlines at 05:05 PM

Arrive in BURBANK, CA (BUR) at 06:10 PM

Travel Time 1 hrs 5 mins

Business Select

Bags fly free®: First and second checked bags. Weight and size limits
apply. One small bag and one personal item are permitted as carryon
items, free of charge.

30 minutes before departure: We encourage you to arrive in the gate
area no later than 30 minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure as
we may begin boarding as early as 30 minutes before your flight.

10 minutes before departure: You must obtain your boarding pass(es)
and be in the gate area for boarding at least 10 minutes prior to your flight's
scheduled departure time. If not, Southwest may cancel your reserved
space and you will not be eligible for denied boarding compensation.

If you do not plan to travel on your flight: In accordance with
Southwest's No Show Policy, you must notify Southwest at least 10

Sign Up 'n Save

•----

[I] 

I 

I 

[I] 
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minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure if you do not plan to travel
on your flight. Customers who fail to cancel reservations for a Wanna Get
Away fare segment at least ten (10) minutes prior to travel and who do not
board the flight will be considered a no show, and all remaining unused
Wanna Get Away funds will be forfeited. All remaining unused Business
Select and Anytime funds will be converted to reusable travel funds. If you
no show your reward travel reservation, the points will be redeposited to the
purchaser's Rapid Rewards account. Any taxes and fees associated with
your reward travel reservation will be held for future use in the form of
reusable travel funds under the name of the traveler(s).

Need to make a change? Keep your confirmation number on record. It will
be used to retrieve your reservation and apply funds to future travel.

Air Cost: 537.96

Fare Rule(s): 5261419929099: NONTRANSFERABLE -BG WN 
Valid only on Southwest Airlines. All travel involving funds from this Confirmation
Number must be completed by the expiration date. Unused travel funds may only
be applied toward the purchase of future travel for the individual named on the
ticket. Any changes to this itinerary may result in a fare increase. 

BUR WN OAK236.91WN BUR236.91USD473.82END ZP BUR4.20OAK4.20 XF
BUR4.5OAK4.5 

KZBP 
KZBP 

Learn about our
boarding process

Learn about inflight
WiFi & entertainment

Cost and Payment Summary

AIR - S36X3R

Base Fare $ 473.82

Excise Taxes $ 35.54

September 11th Security Fee $ 11.20

Segment Fee $ 8.40

Passenger Facility Charge $ 9.00

Total Air Cost $ 537.96

 

Payment Information

Payment Type: Amer Express XXXXXXXXXXX2006

Date: Mar 2, 2018 

Payment Amount: $537.96 

Useful Tools

Check In Online

Early Bird Check-In

View/Share Itinerary

Change Air Reservation

Cancel Air Reservation

Check Flight Status

Flight Status Notification

Book a Car

Book a Hotel

Know Before You Go

In the Airport

Baggage Policies

Suggested Airport Arrival Times

Security Procedures

Customers of Size

In the Air

Purchasing and Refunds

Special Travel Needs

Traveling with Children

Traveling with Pets

Unaccompanied Minors

Baby on Board

Customers with Disabilities

Enroll Now. It's Free

D D 

• 
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DAVID A. ROTMAN 
MEDIATED NEGOTIATIONS 

FOUR EMBARCADERO CENTER, SUITE 1400 

SAN FRANCISCO, CALIFORNIA 94 I// 

Telephone: (415) 543-3366 

www. David Rotman.net 

Joshua H. Haffner, Esq. 

Haffner Law PC 

445 South Figueroa Street, Sutie 2325 

Los Angeles, CA 90071 

Re: 
File Number: 

Your Client: 

Ibana, et al. v. Wells Fargo Bank, NA 

18721 
Jacqueline lbana, et al. 

INVOICE 

Mediation Services Rendered on March 21, 2018 

(Total Fee $23,500.00) 

Balance 

PAYMENT DUE ON March 7, 2018 

Please put file number on check to ensure proper credit and send to: 

David A. Rotman 

Four Embarcadero Center, Suite 1400 

San Francisco, CA 94111 

January 29, 2018 

$5,875.00 

$5,875.00 
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Business Platinum Card® 

HAFFNER LAW PC 

JOSHUAH HAFFNER 

Closing Date 04/19/18 

Payments and Credits 
Summary

Payments 

Credits 

J 

Total Payments and Credits 

[ Detail *Indicates posting date 

Payments 

03/27/18*  

04/09/18* 

Credits 

03/21/18  

03/26/18  

04/10/18*  

I 
New Charges 
Summary

  

 

Detail

JOSHUAH HAFFNER 

Card Ending 8-73004 

03/21/18 BOB HOPE AIRPORT 

81 8-840-8840 

03/21/18 S WA INFLIGHT WIFI 

COMPUTER NET 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

BURBANK CA 

WESTLAKE VILLAG E CA 

  

  

p. 3/9 

Account Ending 8-73004 

Total 

- 

- 

- 

Amount 

- 

- 

Amount 

 

- 

 

Total 

 

 

 

 

Amount 

$24.00 

$8.00 

 

 

Continued on reverse 
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JOSHUAH HAFFNER Account Ending 8-73004 

[ Detail Continued 

 

03/23/18 

(03/23/18 

 

03/26/18 

03/26/18 

03/26/18 

03/26/18 

03/27/18 

03/28/18 

03/28/18 

03/30/18 

03/30/18 

03/30/18 

03/31/18 

03/31/18 

04/01/18 

04/01/18 

04/02/18 

04/02/18 

04/02/18 

04/02/18 

04/02/18 

04/03/18 

04/04/18 

04/04/18 

04/04/18 

 

 

 

ELITE SEDAN SERVICE 084870017863298 
8883548353 
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SAN BRUNO 
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Amount 

  

  

CA $95.00 

  

 
  

  

  

  

  

  

 

 
  

 
  

 

 
  

  

  

  

  

 
  

  

  

Continued on next page 
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